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Executive Summary 
Independent	schools'	alumni	engagement	
programming	often	lacks	creative	strategy	
and	valid	measures	of	engagement	beyond	
dollars	donated	and	attendance	at	alumni	
events	(CASE,	2018).	Despite	the	fact	that	
independent	school	alumni	are	often	well	
educated,	 successful,	 and	 uniquely	
strengthened	by	vast	intergenerational	so-
cial	 capital	 networks,	 the	 majority	 of	
independent	 schools	 struggle	 to	 inspire	
their	alumni	to	give	time,	treasure	and	tal-
ent	 back	 to	 their	 alma	 mater	 (Gallup	 &	
NAIS,	2017).		This	phenomenon	of	detach-
ment	of	alumni	 should	cause	concern	 for	
independent	 school	development	officers	
and	administrative	 leaders,	who	confront	
challenges	 in	 enrollment	 and	 fundraising	
as	 they	 endeavor	 to	 secure	 long-term	 fi-
nancial	security	(Hoerle,	2017;	Hamilton-
Kirk,	 2018).	 	 	Many	 independent	 schools	
operate	on	thin	margins,	and	exercise	high	
discount	 rates	 to	 maintain	 enrollment	
(CASE,	2018).	As	tuition-driven	organiza-
tions,	 fundraising	 is	 a	 critical	 pillar	 of	
sustainability	 and	 long-term	 success	 for	
independent	 schools,	 and	 alumni	 repre-
sent	 the	 largest	 constituency	 for	 raising	
funds	(NAIS,	2019).		

This	study	focuses	on	exploring	how	inde-
pendent	 schools	 can	 confront	 this	
challenge,	 and	 find	ways	 to	 inspire	more	
meaningful	 and	 impactful	 modalities	 of	
engagement	for	their	alumni.		SCP,	the	fo-
cal	organization	partnering	in	this	study,	is	

emblematic	 of	 hundreds	 of	 independent	
schools	nationwide.	A	selective,	large,	pre-
K-12	 independent	 school	 in	 the	 United	
States,	 SCP	 possesses	 an	 alumni	 body	 of	
over	8000	who	demonstrate	very	 limited	
engagement.	 Like	 many	 independent	
school	administrators,	 the	 team	at	SCP	 is	
actively	seeking	answers	to	questions	like	
“How	can	we	more	effectively	engage	our	
alumni?”	and	“Why	 is	our	alumni	partici-
pation	not	stronger?”		

For	the	purposes	of	this	study,	I	am	defin-
ing	 alumni	 engagement	 as	 a	 group	 of	
behaviors	in	which	alumni:	dedicate	their	
time	to	their	alma	mater,	donate	their	tal-
ents	to	their	alma	mater,	make	a	financial	
gift	 to	 their	 alma	 mater,	 and/or	 interact	
with	fellow	alumni	in	ways	which	enhance	
the	alma	mater’s	social	capital	networks	of	
collaboration	and/or	community.	My	pro-
ject	investigates	the	following	concepts	at	
SCP,	which	 are	 reflective	 of	 a	 conceptual	
framework	 undergirded	 by	 the	 pillars	 of	
social	identity	theory	and	communities	of	
practice	theory:		

• Social	 identity	 as	 an	 array	 of	 dynamic	
forces	 that	 respond	 to	 shifts	 in	 group	
relations	 and	 contexts	 (Hogg	 et.	 al.,	
1995)		

• The	 social	 systems	 of	 learning	 which	
help	to	shape	and	empower	communi-
ties	(Wenger,	1998)	

• The	 influence	 of	 group	 membership,	
psychological	 intertwinement,	 and	 the	
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salience	of	identity	on	engagement	be-
haviors	(Hogg	&	Turner,	1985)	

The	 extant	 literature	 on	 alumni	 engage-
ment	 and	 independent	 school	
communities	also	informs	my	understand-
ing	 of	 the	 conditions,	 context,	 and	
engagement	behaviors	of	alumni	organiza-
tions	and	their	members.		

This	challenge	faced	by	SCP	and	so	many	
independent	 schools	 across	 the	 country	
inspires	my	central	research	questions:			

1. How	 do	 personal	 and	 social	 identity	
shape	forms	of	alumni	engagement?		

2. How	do	different	 forms	of	alumni	en-
gagement	foster	a	sense	of	belonging?		

3. What	can	schools	do	 to	provide	more	
meaningful	 and	 impactful	 forms	 of	
alumni	engagement?		

To	address	my	research	questions,	I	used	
an	 exploratory	 mixed	 methods	 design,	
which	 relied	 primarily	 upon	 qualitative	
methods	with	purposive	 sampling.	A	 site	
visit,	 interviews,	 and	 focus	 groups	 were	
the	cornerstone	of	data	collection.	SCP	also	
provided	me	with	a	robust	array	of	mate-
rials	 ranging	 from	 internal	 performance	
data	 to	 print	 and	 digital	media	 collateral	
which	 enhanced	 the	 research	 process	
through	data	and	document	analysis.	After	
integrating	 all	 of	 these	 components	 and	
engaging	in	a	rigorous	analysis,	the	follow-
ing	 relevant	 findings	 in	 this	 study	 were	
identified:	

Finding 1 
SCP	alumni	with	more	than	one	SCP	layer	
of	 identity	 demonstrate	 more	 salience	
with	 the	 organization,	 which	 enhances	
their	sense	of	belonging	and	actively	moti-
vates	 them	 towards	 engagement	
behaviors.	

Finding 2 
The	deep	and	lasting	relationships	of	SCP	
alumni	with	faculty	and	fellow	alumni	ac-
tively	 enhance	 their	 feelings	 of	
community,	 belonging	 and	 psychological	
intertwinement	 with	 SCP.	 This	 furthers	
their	 self-identification	 with	 SCP	 and	 in-
spires	engagement.	

Finding 3 
Regardless	of	positive	or	negative	past	or	
present	feelings	about	SCP,	alumni	unilat-
erally	 express	 strong	 feelings	 of	 pride	
about	being	an	SCP	alumnus/a.		

Finding 4 
SCP’s	core	value	of	academic	excellence	is	
a	powerful	driver	of	SCP	alumni	pride.		

Finding 5 
Alumni-oriented	 communications	 inte-
grating	personal	 stories	 and	nostalgia	on	
school-related	 media	 fuel	 feelings	 of	 be-
longingness	 and	 community	 for	 SCP	
alumni,	and	can	motivate	alumni	towards	
engagement	behaviors.		
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Finding 6 
Geography	matters.	 SCP	Alumni	who	 are	
more	physically	distant	 from	campus	are	
less	 interested	 in	engaging	with	SCP,	and	
express	a	lack	of	incentive	and	connected-
ness.	

Finding 7 
SCP	 alumni	 seek	 engagement	 program-
ming	 that	 extends	 beyond	 the	 scope	 of	
social	events,	 including	calls	 to	action	 for	
mentorship	 opportunities,	 sharing	
knowledge	and	expertise,		community	ser-
vice	 activities,	 and	 affinity	 group	
gatherings.	

On	the	basis	of	my	 findings,	 I	am	making	
intervention	 recommendations	 that	 are	
aligned	with	the	canon	of	literature,	are	re-
flective	of	the	distinct	SCP	community,	and	
also	 bear	 relevance	 for	 the	 independent	
school	 domain	 at	 large,	 as	 it	 collectively	
wrestles	 with	 alumni	 engagement	 strat-
egy.	 Recommendations	 are	 concentrated	
around	 the	 five	 themes	 which	 emerged	
through	 the	 coding	 and	 analysis	 pro-
cesses:	 alumni	 engagement,	 core	 values,	
community	 and	 culture,	 social	 identity/	
belongingness,	 meaningful	 shared	 prac-
tices,	and	narratives/storytelling.	

Contextual Analysis 
Focal	Site	Characteristics.	SCP	is	a	selec-
tive,	large,	pre-K-12	independent	school	in	
the	 United	 States,	 which	was	 founded	 in	
the	1930’s	and	possesses	an	alumni	body	

of	 over	 8000.	 Like	 many	 independent	
school	administrations,	the	team	at	SCP	is	
actively	 wrestling	 with	 the	 challenge	 of	
alumni	engagement.		This	is	evidenced	by	
a	2017	 internal	 SCP	 report	 (Appendix	A)	
which	 characterized	 the	 alumni	 program	
as	“in	its	infancy	stage”	and	“underutilized	
in	advancing	the	mission	of	the	school,”		as	
well	 as	 SCP	 giving	 data	 (Appendix	 B)	
which	 consistently	 demonstrates	 3.3%	
alumni	participation	in	the	annual	fund,	a	
rate	6%	below	the	independent	school	na-
tional	 average	 (NAIS,	 2019).	 SCP’s	
phenomenon	of	lackluster	alumni	engage-
ment	 sits	 in	 contrast	 to	 a	 backdrop	 of	
otherwise	 enviable	 excellence.	 Boasting	
full	enrollment	(with	over	2000	students),	
exceptional	 college	 placement	 data	 (Ap-
pendix	 C),	 a	 robust	 $75	 million	
endowment,	and	a	legacy	of	highly	accom-
plished	alumni,	SCP	still	actively	struggles	
to	 effectively	 engage	 its	 alumni.	 	 Given	
their	difficulties	with	alumni	engagement,	
SCP	was	interested	in	partnering	in	order	
to	 explore	 how	 best	 to	 improve	 their	
alumni	engagement.	SCP	was	particularly	
keen	to	collaborate,	as	they	prepare	to	em-
bark	upon	the	largest	capital	campaign	in	
school	 history,	 and	 seek	 out	 avenues	 for	
optimization	 of	 community-building	 and	
fundraising.		

Independent	 School	 Community	 Char-
acteristics.	The	context	and	culture	which	
distinguish	 independent	 schools	 from	
other	 educational	 communities	 are	 also	
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important	considerations	which	help	to	in-
form	our	understanding	of	how	alumni	at	
institutions	like	SCP	behave.		The	National	
Association	of	Independent	Schools,	which	
serves	 as	 the	 primary	 accreditation	 and	
governance	 guild	 for	 1500	 member	
schools	 across	 the	 United	 States,	 defines	
independent	schools	as	non-profit	educa-
tional	 settings	 which	 are	 each	 centered	
upon	 a	 unique	 mission	 (NAIS.org).	 Gov-
erned	 by	 an	 independent	 board	 of	
trustees,	 these	 schools	 source	 funding	
through	 tuition	and	charitable	donations.	
NAIS	 further	 characterizes	 independent	
schools	 as	 “close-knit	 communities	 that	
provide	 students	 with	 individualized	 at-
tention…	 challenging	 [them]	 to	 stretch	
their	minds	and	go	beyond	academics”	to	
become	 “responsible,	 independent,	 and	
community-oriented	students”	(NAIS.org).	
Varying	 in	 size,	 age,	 and	 religious	 affilia-
tion,	 independent	 schools	 are	 perhaps	
best	known	for	their	strong	sense	of	com-
munity,	small	class	sizes,	and	dedication	to	
ideals	of	collaboration,	social	responsibil-
ity,	 equity,	 and	 excellence	
(AIMSMDDC.org,	 CAISCA.org,	 AISNE.org,	
SAIS.org).		A	recent	Gallup	report	of	NAIS	
alumni	 survey	 data	 concluded	 that	 NAIS	
alumni	have	a	higher	probability	of	 com-
pleting	 their	 college	 degree	 on	 time	 and	
are	also	 less	 likely	to	transfer	during	col-
lege.	 The	 report	 asserts	 that	 “this	
consistent	progression	 through	college	 is	
linked	with	financial	advantages	—	lower	
student	debt	and	higher	starting	salaries	–	
as	 well	 as	 higher	 career	 satisfaction	 and	

well-being	 later	 in	 life”	 (Gallup	 &	 NAIS,	
2017).	 	 The	 common	 cultural	 values	 of	
close-knit	community,	personal	attention,	
and	academic	achievement	may	persist	in	
the	lives	of	independent	school	alumni	af-
ter	graduation,	playing	a	role	in	how	they	
interact	with	 their	 alma	mater,	 and	what	
they	 expect	 from	 their	 alma	 mater	 as	
alumni.		

Literature Review 
Alumni	Engagement.	The	available	schol-
arly	 research	 on	 alumni	 engagement	 in	
education	 is	 almost	 exclusively	 based	 in	
institutions	of	higher	education,	revealing	
a	gap	 in	 the	 formal	 investigation	of	 inde-
pendent	 schools.	 Alumni	 engagement	 in	
the	 post-secondary	 domain	 literature	 is	
consistently	recognized	as	a	multi-faceted	
user	experience,	which	integrates	a	combi-
nation	 of	 internal	 and	 external	 variables	
(McDearmon	 and	 Shirley,	 2009;	 Monks,	
2003;	Weerts	and	Ronca,	2007).	This	char-
acterization	 is	 consistent	 with	 how	
independent	school	alumni	relations	pro-
fessionals	 commonly	 describe	 alumni	
engagement	as	requiring	complex	“multi-
pronged	 outreach	 that	 embraces	 high-
tech,	while	maintaining	high-touch	efforts	
that	have	been	used	 for	decades”	 (Grace,	
2019).		Several	themes	emerge	in	the	liter-
ature	to	shape	our	understanding	of	what	
lead	alumni	to	engage	with	their	alma	ma-
ter.	 These	 include	 satisfaction	with	 alma	
mater	 (past	 and	 present),	 personal	 fi-
nances/wealth,	 group/affinity	 trends,	
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communication	 strategies,	 and	 iden-
tity/engagement	values.		

Satisfaction	with	Alma	Mater	as	a	Pre-
dictor	 of	 Donor	 Behavior.	 The	
satisfaction	 alumni	 feel	 about	 their	 stu-
dent	 experience	 is	 a	 strong	 predictor	 of	
alumni	giving	and	engagement.	Baade	and	
Sundberg’s	research	results	(1996)	found	
that	alumni	are	more	likely	to	engage	with	
their	 alma	 mater	 if	 their	 experience	 has	
been	 positive.	 	 Monk’s	 findings	 (2003)	
demonstrated	 that	 younger	 alumni	 who	
were	 satisfied	 with	 their	 student	 experi-
ence	 donated	 2.6	 times	more	 than	 those	
who	were	less	satisfied.	Clotfelter’s	study	
(2003)	 echoed	 Monk’s	 findings,	 but	 also	
unearthed	the	significance	of	the	“mentor	
variable,”	which	speaks	to	the	importance	
that	 alumni	 attach	 to	 personal	 contacts	
with	faculty.	Alumni	who	recalled	having	a	
mentor	as	a	student	were	twice	as	likely	to	
indicate	they	were	very	satisfied	with	their	
college	experience,	and	make	a	gift	back	to	
their	 alma	 mater.	 	 Weerts	 and	 Ronca	
(2009)	found	that	larger	gifts	were	corre-
lated	 with	 alumni	 who	 perceived	 their	
alma	mater	as	academically	strong	overall	
and	wished	 to	be	 affiliated	with	 a	 strong	
academic	 organization.	 The	 findings	 of	
Tsao	and	Coll	(2005)	also	affirmed	the	crit-
ical	 role	 of	 alumni	 satisfaction	 in	 giving	
and	engagement.	

Individual	alumni	financial	circumstances	
also	play	a	key	role	in	giving	(Weerts	and	
Ronca,	2009).	In	the	readings,	this	was	di-
versely	 reflected	 in	 issues	 ranging	 from	

income,	to	career	choices,	to	debt.	Alumni	
who	 occupy	 certain	 high	 paying	 careers	
are	 much	 more	 likely	 to	 donate	 to	 their	
alma	mater;	namely,	alumni	who	have	JDs	
and	MBAs	 give	 gifts	 which	 are	 22%	 and	
57%	 (respectively)	 larger	 than	 alumni	
without	advanced	degrees	(Monks,	2003).	
Tsoa	and	Coll’s	(2005)	findings	also	corre-
lated	 alumni	 income	 levels	 with	 donor	
intentionality;	alumni	who	had	higher	sal-
aries	were	more	likely	to	pledge	to	donate	
to	 their	 alma	 mater.	 Financial	 circum-
stances	in	which	alumni	were	less	likely	to	
give	 included	 unemployment	 and	 over-
commitment,	when	alumni	feel	an	obliga-
tion	to	give	to	multiple	alma	maters	and	so	
their	 giving	 is	 “crowded	 out”	 (Smith	 and	
Price,	2017,	Weerts	and	Ronca,	2009.)	All	
in	all,	the	literature	clearly	reveals	that	the	
correlation	 between	 alumni	 giving	 and	
household	income	is	strong.		

Group/Affinity	 Trends.	 Scholars	 identi-
fied	several	areas	of	concentration	within	
alumni	 bodies	 where	 giving	 and	 engage-
ment	were	more	pronounced.	Historically,	
women	have	been	identified	as	being	more	
philanthropic	overall	than	men,	(Thelin	&	
Trollinger,	 2014)	 and	 research	 has	 also	
proven	that	being	an	older	alumnus/a	is	a	
predictor	 of	 the	 likelihood	 of	 donating	
both	time	as	a	volunteer	and	money	to	the	
institution	 (Weerts	 and	 Ronca,	 2009).		
Older	alumni	have	also	been	proven	to	be	
more	generous	at	reunion	moments	 than	
younger	 alumni	 (Clotfelter,	 2003).	 Other	
groups	where	trends	were	revealed	in	the	
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literature	are	former	financial	aid	students	
and	students	who	are	part	of	legacy	fami-
lies	at	a	school.	While	the	first	group	tends	
to	give	less,	the	second	group	tends	to	give	
more	(Clotfelter,	2003).	The	dominant	af-
finity	 group	 which	 emerged	 in	 the	
research	are	alumni	who	have	an	interest	
in	 athletics;	 institutions	 are	 consistently	
“rewarded	by	their	alumni	for	sports	pro-
grams	 that	 are	 extremely	 successful.	
Athletic	success	has	an	immediate	impact	
on	 alumni	 generosity”	 (Baade	 and	
Sundberg,	1996).		

Communication	Strategies.	Relevant	lit-
erature	 around	 communications	
strategies	 which	 affect	 giving	 behavior	
with	alumni	elucidates	the	value	of	a	num-
ber	 of	 techniques.	 These	 include	 a	 clear	
and	compelling	expression	of	institutional	
need	for	gifts,	appeals	targeted	specifically	
toward	 alumni	 (as	 opposed	 to	 sweeping	
appeals	to	all	constituents),	and	strategies	
crafted	 around	 ongoing,	 multi-platform	
communications	 and	 interactions	 be-
tween	 the	 school	 and	 the	 alumni	 body	
(Weerts	 &	 Ronca,	 2009,	 Baade	 and	
Sundberg,	 1996,	 Tsao	 &	 Coll,	 2005).	 The	
most	 potent	 finding	 in	 the	 research	 was	
around	communication	concepts	of	expec-
tation	 and	 need;	 	 when	 it	 was	 clearly	
communicated	 to	 alumni	 that	 they	 were	
expected	 to	donate	 time	and	money,	 and	
that	their	support	was	essential	to	the	in-
stitution,	volunteers	were	9.28	times	more	
likely	 to	give	 time,	and	past	donors	were	

2.8	times	more	likely	to	give	money	(We-
erts	 &	 Ronca	 ,	 2009).	 	 This	 finding	
interestingly	 illuminates	 that	 alumni	 not	
only	increased	their	engagement	behavior	
in	response	to	these	kinds	of	communica-
tion,	but	also	that	they	did	so	in	the	same	
category	of	engagement	(monetary/time).		
Conversely,	 if	 alumni	 perceive	 through	
school	 communications	 that	 their	 alma	
mater	is	thriving	and	does	not	need	their	
support,	alumni	giving	is	diminished	(We-
erts	 and	 Ronca,	 2009).	 	 A	 study	 by	 Tsao	
and	Coll	(2005)	affirmed	the	value	of	on-
going,	frequent	and	varied	communication	
to	alumni	as	well	as	offering	varied	oppor-
tunities	 for	 interaction	between	 the	alma	
mater	and	alumni.	A	variety	of	communi-
cations	was	strongly	preferred	by	younger	
alumni,	 who	 “balked	 at	 the	 institution	
communicating	only	to	ask	for	money,	ra-
ther	 than	 to	 provide	 services	 or	
networking	 platforms	 at	 no	 charge	 to	
alumni”	 (McDearmon,	 2010).	 The	 litera-
ture	confirmed	that	more	communication	
is	best	when	it	comes	to	motivating	alumni	
engagement.	 If	 alumni	 were	 in	 regular	
communications	 with	 their	 alma	 mater	
and	 were	 consistently	 asked	 to	 get	 in-
volved,	 overall	 volunteer	 and	 donor	
behaviors	 increased	 (Weerts	 &	 Ronca,	
2009).		

Identity/Engagement	 Values.	 This	 last	
theme	which	surfaced	in	the	literature	en-
compasses	the	feelings	and	actions	which	
demonstrate	camaraderie	with	one’s	alma	
mater	 and	 a	 sense	 of	 shared	 values	with	
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the	 institution.	 A	 strong	 expression	 of	
one’s	 identity	 integration	 with	 the	 alma	
mater	 is	known	as	salience,	and	research	
suggested	that	an	 increase	 in	salience	to-
wards	 being	 an	 alumnus(a)	 can	 increase	
engagement	 behaviors	 (McDear-
mon,2010).		Weerts	and	Ronca’s	research	
revealed	that	“the	most	committed	alumni	
have	chosen	to	make	the	institution	an	im-
portant	part	of	their	life	after	graduation.	
Their	personal	initiative	to	stay	connected	
indicates	an	emotional	attachment	 to	 the	
university	 and	 is	 reflected	 in	 their	 giving	
and	 volunteerism”	 (Weerts	 &	 Ronca,	
2009).	Another	major	predictor	of	alumni	
giving	in	the	literature	was	engagement	in	
campus	 activities	 and	 programs.	 Attend-
ing	 alumni	 events,	 athletic	 programs,	
cultural	 gatherings,	 volunteering	 on	 a	
committee,	and	participating	in	the	alumni	
association	were	 all	 behaviors	 that	were	
common	 amongst	 financially	 supportive	
alumni	 (McDearmon,	 2013).	 Weerts	 and	
Ronca	(2009)	found	that	alumni	who	vol-
unteer	and	give	money	are	1.5	times	more	
likely	 than	 inactive	 alumni	 to	 have	 at-
tended	 athletic	 events,	 cultural	 activities,	
or	 visited	 campus	 since	 graduation.	 The	
literature	reviewed	consistently	maintains	
that	engaging	in	school	activities,	sharing	
values	with	 the	 alma	mater,	 and	 identity	
salience	as	an	alumnus/a	of	the	organiza-
tion	all	positively	drive	alumni	giving	and	
engagement.		

Conclusion.	A	review	of	the	literature	re-
lated	to	alumni	engagement	suggests	that	

there	 are	 known	 challenges	 to	 engaging	
alumni,	and	known	strategies	for	targeting	
improvement	 in	 alumni	 engagement	out-
comes.	The	findings	about	the	engagement	
behaviors	of	certain	alumni	groups	are	di-
verse,	but	a	generalization	of	the	research	
might	 be	 to	 say	 that	 older,	 local	 female	
alumni	 who	 are	 lawyers	 or	 doctors	 are	
most	likely	to	donate.	If	they	follow	school	
athletics	 and	 are	 part	 of	 a	 legacy	 family,	
their	odds	of	giving	time,	talent,	or	treas-
ure	 to	 their	 alma	mater	 further	 increase.		
The	 literature	 suggests	 that	 devising	 a	
school	 communications	 plan	 which	 opti-
mizes	 the	 probability	 of	 alumni	
engagement	 involves	 targeted	 alumni	
campaigns	and	a	steady	flow	of	varied	for-
mats	 (online,	 print,	 etc.)	 paired	 with	
regular	 opportunities	 to	 participate	 in	
school-sponsored	events.	 	 Finally,	 the	 re-
sults	 presented	 in	 these	 articles	
emphasize	 that	engaging	 in	school	activi-
ties,	 sharing	 values	with	 the	 alma	mater,	
and	 identity	 salience	 as	 an	 alumnus/a	 of	
the	 organization	 all	 positively	 drive	
alumni	giving	and	engagement.			

However,	 current	 analyses	 overlook	 the	
unique	 alumni	 relations	 landscape	of	 the	
independent	school	domain,	which	is	con-
siderably	 more	 intimate	 than	 the	 higher	
education	alumni	relations	realm.		Charac-
terized	 by	 close-knit	 communities,	 joint	
emphases	on	personal	attention	and	aca-
demic	 excellence,	 and	 a	 dedication	 to	
mission-driven	culture	and	identity,	inde-
pendent	 schools’	 alumni	 represent	 a	
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distinctive	cohort	of	alumni.	Through	the	
lens	 of	my	 conceptual	 frameworks,	 com-
munities	 of	 practice	 theory	 and	 social	
identity	 theory,	my	 research	 seeks	 to	ex-
plore	 how	 to	 best	 address	 the	 particular	
needs,	challenges,	and	possibilities	 inher-
ent	to	alumni	engagement	practices	within	
independent	school	communities.	

Conceptual Framework 
Prior	literature	on	alumni	engagement	and	
giving	 in	 particular	 highlights	 the	 im-
portance	 of	 community	 and	 identity.	
Situating	this	study	of	alumni	engagement	
in	an	 independent	school	 thus	requires	a	
deeper	understanding	of	these	ideas.	SCP’s	
focal	 challenge	 of	 insufficient	 alumni	 en-
gagement	 can	 therefore	 be	 meaningfully	
investigated	 through	 the	 lenses	 of	 two	
conceptual	 frameworks:	 	 communities	 of	
practice	theory	and	social	identity	theory.		

Communities	 of	 Practice	 Theory.	
Wenger	&	Snyder	(2000)	define	communi-
ties	 of	 practice	 as	 “fertile	 organizational	
forms”	 which	 typically	 exist	 within	 the	
context	of	 a	 larger	organization.	Unlike	a	
team,	which	is	put	together	by	a	manager	
to	 achieve	 specific	 tasks,	 a	 community	of	
practice	 is	 informally	 organized	 with	 a	
purpose	 of	 building	 upon	 or	 sharing	
knowledge	 in	 flexible	 and	 dynamic	ways	
(Wenger,	1998).	The	concept	of	communi-
ties	 of	 practice	 can	 help	 shape	 our	
understanding	of	how	alumni	might	more	
meaningfully	interact	with	one	another	as	

a	 form	 of	 alumni	 engagement.	 	 Typically	
conceived	around	“joint	enterprises”,	com-
munities	 of	 practice	 are	 voluntary	 and	
have	a	 core	group	of	 actors	who	provide	
intellectual	 and	 social	 leadership,	 which	
serves	 to	 energize	 fellow	 participants	
(Wenger,	 1998).	 	 Within	 the	 context	 of	
alumni	communities,	this	characteristic	of	
communities	of	practice	 is	germane,	as	 it	
suggests	that	factions	of	alumni	might	gal-
vanize	 around	particular	 activities	which	
pique	shared	interests,	passions,	or	skills.			

Knowledge,	experience,	and	information	is	
shared	 in	 unstructured	 and	 inventive	
ways	within	a	community	of	practice,	and	
the	community	emerges	around	ideas	and	
work	 that	matter	 to	people	 (Lave,	1996).		
Lave	describes	communities	of	practice	as	
having	“permeable	boundaries”	character-
ized	 by	 a	 fluidity	 of	 roles,	 and	 fostering	
learning	 through	 mentorship	 and	 an	 in-
crease	 in	 one’s	 participation	 over	 time.	
Newcomers	 may	 enter	 a	 community	 of	
practice,	and	find	mentorship	through	re-
lations	with	more	experienced	old-timers,	
while	both	cohorts	are	simultaneously	cul-
tivating	 identities	 as	 members	 of	 a	
sustained	 community	 (Lave,	 1991).	
Wenger	 represents	 this	 process	 of	 navi-
gating	 from	 the	 edges	 to	 the	 core	 of	 a	
community	 of	 practice	 with	 a	 model	 of	
stages	of	development	(Figure	1,	Wenger,	
1998),	which	 illustrates	 the	different	 lev-
els	of	interaction	among	the	members	and	
different	kinds	of	activities	associated	with	
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each	level.		These	characteristic	of	commu-
nities	 of	 practice	 align	 well	 with	 the	
structure	 of	 alumni	 associations,	 which	
are	inherently	vast	and	disperse,	but	read-
ily	 invite	 the	 formation	 of	 affinity-based	
collectives	due	to	a	shared	sense	of	 iden-
tity	 as	 alumni.	 Furthermore,	 alumni	
associations	 are	 in	 a	 constant	 cycle	 of	
membership	 replenishment.	 The	 annual	
addition	of	newcomers	to	the	alumni	body,	
along	with	the	increasing	longevity	of	old-
timers,	 provides	 a	 generative	 context	 in	
which	 potential	 communities	 of	 practice	
might	emerge.			

Social	 Identity	 Theory.	Tajfel	 &	 Turner	
(1979)	 suggest	 that	 the	 groups	 to	which	
people	 belong	 are	 an	 essential	 source	 of	
pride	and	self-esteem.	Social	groups	offer	

individuals	 a	 framework	 for	 social	 iden-
tity:	 a	way	of	belonging	within	 the	 social	
world	(Tajfel	&	Turner,	1979).	Within	the	
context	of	alumni	relations,	these	concepts	
are	particularly	relevant,	as	alumni	organ-
izations	automatically	conglomerate	all	of	
the	individuals	who	attended	a	particular	
institution	into	a	shared	social	group,	and	
these	groups	often	coalesce	around	shared	
symbols,	 traditions,	and	feelings	of	pride.	
Ashford	&	Mael	(1989)	described	this	pro-
cess	of	social	identification	as	a	perception	
of	 belongingness	 to	 “some	 human	 aggre-
gate.”	 The	 literature	 on	 group	
identification	 indicates	 that	one	does	not	
need	to	put	forth	effort	toward	the	goals	of	
an	organization	in	order	to	identify	with	it;	
rather,	 an	 individual	 “need	only	perceive	
him	 or	 herself	 as	 psychologically	 inter-

twined	with	the	fate	
of	the	group”	(Foote,	
1951).	 	 This	 raises	
questions	about	how	
the	 sense	 of	 “inter-
twinement”	 alumni	
feel	 with	 their	 alma	
mater	may	motivate	
them	 towards	 en-
gagement	behaviors,	
and	 how	 those	who	
make	 no	 overt	 ges-
tures	 of	 alumni	
engagement	 may	
still	 meaningfully	
socially	identify	as	a	
member	 of	 their	
alumni	 community,	Figure	1,	(Wenger,	1998)	
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with	 a	 capacity	 for	 future	 engagement.		
Foote	advanced	 this	argument	by	 finding	
that	 when	 individuals	 socially	 identified	
with	a	particular	group,	they	also	person-
ally	 experienced	 both	 the	 successes	 and	
failures	of	that	group	at	large.	This	raises	
questions	about	the	ways	in	which	schools	
can	 more	 authentically	 connect	 with	
alumni	during	moments	of	institutional	ac-
complishment	 and	 setback,	 to	 promote	
stronger	social	identification.		

Tajfel	 and	 Turner	 (1985)	 also	 theorized	
that	a	social	category	into	which	one	falls	
(e.g.,	 alma	 mater	 affiliation),	 and	 with	
which	one	feels	a	sense	of	belonging,	con-
tributes	to	the	definition	of	who	one	 is—
an	element	of	a	person’s	overall	self-con-
cept.	 People	 have	 a	 collection	 of	 these	
distinct	 social	 category	 memberships	
which	vary	in	relative	importance	to	one’s	
self-	 concept	 (Hogg,	 et.	 al.,	 1995).	 People	
evaluate	 themselves	 based	 upon	 their	
group	memberships,	and	are	motivated	to	
adopt	behaviors	which	enable	them	to	re-
main	 tied	 to	 groups	 they	 and	 others	
perceive	 as	 favorable.	 These	 findings	 are	
important	because:		

Alumni of independent schools likely 
have multiple social category member-
ships—where does one’s independent 
school alma mater rank in that mix?  A 
lower ranking (relative to one’s college 
alma mater, for example) would result in 
fewer behaviors (such as alumni engage-
ment behaviors) that are motivated by a 
desire to remain tied to the group.   

	

This	also	has	relevance	because	it	begs	the	
question,	what	additional	categories	of	so-
cial	 identity	 might	 reinforce	 or	 upgrade	
the	importance	of	one’s	status	as	an	inde-
pendent	 school	 alumnus/a?	 Factors	 such	
as	having	a	child	who	attends	or	is	apply-
ing	to	their	alma	mater,	serving	on	one	of	
the	school’s	boards	or	committees,	and	be-
ing	married	 to	a	 fellow	alumnus/a	of	 the	
institution	are	all	factors	which	might	im-
pact	 the	 influence	 that	 element	 of	 one’s	
social	identity	has	on	an	individual’s	over-
all	self-concept.			

Social	identity	theory	literature	also	iden-
tifies	 two	 elements	 which	 are	 likely	 to	
positively	increase	one’s	tendency	to	iden-
tify	 with	 a	 particular	 group.	 	 Both	 have	
direct	relevance	to	alumni	relations	com-
munities.		The	first	is	the	distinctiveness	of	
the	group’s	values	and	practices	in	relation	
to	 comparable	 groups	 (Oakes	 &	 Turner,	
1986).	 Is	 the	 character,	 history,	 mission,	
and	 culture	 of	 one’s	 independent	 school	
alma	mater	unique	in	comparison	to	other	
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secondary	schools?	Are	these	characteris-
tics	 of	 distinctiveness	 effectively	
communicated	 to	 alumni	 through	 media	
and	publications,	and	at	events?	If	so,	the	
trait	of	distinctiveness	serves	as	a	means	
of	promoting	more	alumni	to	identify	with	
their	alma	mater,	and	potentially	engage	in	
behaviors	which	will	nourish	their	ties	to	
the	 group.	 The	 second	 factor	 which	 has	
been	 shown	 to	 increase	 social	 identifica-
tion	with	 the	group	 is	 the	prestige	of	 the	
group	 (Ashforth	 &	 Mael,	 1989).	 Social	
identification	 affects	 self-esteem,	 and	 the	
desire	 to	 be	 associated	 with	 a	 winner	 is	
powerful.	The	perceived	prestige	of	an	in-
dependent	school	may	be	associated	with	
a	variety	of	factors	including	college	place-
ments,	 endowment	 size,	 enrollment	
success,	 attractiveness	 of	 the	 physical	
campus,	 and	 the	 performance	 of	 athletic	
teams.	 Alumni	 relations	 professionals	 at	
schools	 must	 consider	 ways	 in	 which	 to	
proactively	 communicate	 prestige	 points	
to	their	communities,	in	order	to	enhance	
feelings	of	affiliation.	

Through	the	application	of	these	theories	
to	independent	school	alumni	engagement	
behaviors,	 	 this	 study	 investigates	 how	
feelings	 of	 belonging,	 identity,	 and	 com-
munity	 membership	 shape	 independent	
school	 alumni	 engagement.	 This	 includes	
consideration	 of	 the	 ways	 in	 which	 the	
characteristically	"permeable	peripheries"	
(Wenger,	 1998)	 of	 alumni	 communities	
can	 foster	 shared	 enterprises	which	nur-
ture	opportunities	for	valuable	modalities	

of	alumni	engagement	as	well	as	a	consid-
eration	of	the	theoretical	aspects	of	social	
identity	 theory	and	communities	of	prac-
tice	 theory	 which	 synthesize	 with	 the	
distinct	 gestalt	 of	 independent	 school	
communities.	 	 These	 include	 the	 concept	
of	 social	 identity	 as	 a	 dynamic	 construct	
that	responds	 to	shifts	 in	group	relations	
and	contexts	(Hogg	et.	al.,	1995),	the	social	
systems	 of	 learning	which	 help	 to	 shape	
and	 empower	 communities	 (Wenger,	
1998),	 and	 the	 influence	 of	 group	 mem-
bership	 and	 salience	 of	 identity	 on	
engagement	 behaviors	 (Hogg	 &	 Turner,	
1985).		

Problem of Practice and 
Key Research Questions 
SCP struggles to inspire their alumni 
to give time, talent, and/or treasure to 
their alma mater. 
Why	does	 it	matter	 if	SCP	alumni,	or	any	
independent	 school	 alumni	 for	 that	mat-
ter,	 engage	 with	 their	 alma	 mater?	 It’s	
simple.	Many	independent	schools	operate	
on	 thin	 margins,	 and	 exercise	 high	 dis-
count	rates	to	maintain	enrollment	(CASE,	
2018).	 As	 tuition-driven	 organizations,	
fundraising	has	become	a	critical	pillar	of	
sustainability	 and	 long-term	 success	 for	
independent	 schools,	 and	 alumni	 repre-
sent	 the	 largest	 constituency	 for	 raising	
funds	 (NAIS,	 2019).	 	 In	 order	 to	 promote	
long-term	financial	sustainability	and	secu-
rity,	independent	schools	such	as	SCP	must	
effectively	 engage	 this	 large	 and	 valuable	
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group	of	stakeholders.		This	challenge	faced	
by	 SCP,	 and	 independent	 schools	 across	
the	country,	 inspires	my	central	research	
questions:			

1. How	 do	 personal	 and	 social	 identity	
shape	forms	of	alumni	engagement?		

2. How	do	different	 forms	of	alumni	en-
gagement	foster	a	sense	of	belonging?		

3. What	can	schools	do	 to	provide	more	
meaningful	 and	 impactful	 forms	 of	
alumni	engagement?		

For	the	purposes	of	this	study,	alumni	en-
gagement	 is	 defined	 as	 a	 group	 of	
behaviors	in	which	alumni:	dedicate	their	
time	to	their	alma	mater,	donate	their	tal-
ents	to	their	alma	mater,	make	a	financial	
gift	 to	 their	 alma	 mater,	 and/or	 interact	
with	fellow	alumni	in	ways	which	enhance	
the	alma	mater’s	social	capital	networks	of	
collaboration	 and/or	 community.	 Project	
findings	will	provide	a	foundation	to	offer	
SCP	evidence-based	feedback	on	the	prob-
lem	of	practice,	and	guide	the	formation	of	
key	 recommendations	 which	 will	 better	
inform	SCP’s	future	strategy	on	alumni	en-
gagement.		Additionally,	this	research	will	
contribute	 to	 the	 practice	 of	 leadership	
and	learning	within	 independent	schools,	
specifically	in	the	field	of	alumni	relations	
for	independent	schools--thus	far	an	unex-
plored	area	within	the	research.	

Design and Methodology 
This	 project	 design	 is	 an	 exploratory	
mixed	methods	 design,	 which	 relied	 pri-
marily	 upon	 qualitative	 methods	 with	
purposive	sampling.	A	site	visit,	standard-
ized,	 open-ended	 interviews	 (both	 in	
person	and	via	FaceTime)	and	two	in-per-
son	focus	groups	were	the	cornerstone	of	
data	collection.	SCP	also	provided	me	with	
a	 robust	 array	 of	materials	 ranging	 from	
internal	performance	data,	to	print,	social,	
and	 digital	 media	 collateral,	 which	 en-
hanced	the	research	process	through	data	
and	document	review	catalogued	in	a	doc-
ument	analysis	table	(Appendices	A,	B,	C,	
E,	J).		

Interviews and Focus Groups 
Interviews	were	conducted	with	eight	em-
ployees	 (five	 male,	 three	 female)	 at	 SCP	
who	 work	 in	 the	 development	 office,	 as	
well	as	some	who	are	administrative	lead-
ers	in	other	areas	of	the	school	that	share	
common	ground	with	the	domain	of	SCP’s	
alumni	relations.	Employees	were	also	se-
lected	 based	 upon	 their	 availability	 on	 a	
specific	date,	and	therefore	this	was	a	sam-
ple	 of	 convenience,	 which	 has	 its	
limitations.	 Four	 employees	 represented	
SCP’s	executive	leadership	team,	and	four	
employees	 represented	 middle	 manage-
ment.	 Titles	 of	 employee	 interviewees	
included	Vice	 President	 of	 Advancement,	
Director	 of	 Advancement,	 Alumni	 Devel-
opment	 Officer,	 Vice	 President	 of	
Marketing,	 Director	 of	 Alumni	 Relations,	
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Director	 of	 College	 Counseling,	 Head	 of	
Upper	School,	and	Director	of	Parent	Rela-
tions	 and	 Volunteer	 Programs.	 	 One	
employee	 was	 Black,	 and	 the	 remainder	
were	White.		Employees	interviewed	had	a	
range	of	 tenures	at	 SCP	 from	1-36	years,	
and	two	employees	were	alumni.		In	addi-
tion,	two	employees	were	current	parents,	
and	 two	 employees	 were	 parents	 of	
alumni.		

Eleven	SCP	alumni	(five	male,	six	female)	
were	 also	 interviewed.	 	 Five	 of	 these	
alumni	lived	in	proximity	to	SCP’s	campus,	
and	six	lived	in	other	states.	One	alumnus	

was	Black,	one	was	Asian,	and	the	remain-
der	were	White.	Two	of	these	alumni	were	
also	current	parents	at	SCP.	Two	in-person	
alumni	focus	groups	were	also	conducted,	
the	 first	with	 six	 participants	 (two	male,	
four	female)	and	the	second	with	five	par-
ticipants	 (four	 male,	 one	 female),	
following	the	same	interview	protocol.	All	
alumni	participants	in	the	first	focus	group	
were	also	current	parents;	one	participant	
in	 the	 second	 focus	 group	was	 a	 current	
parent.	 Alumni	were	 designated	 to	 focus	
groups	based	upon	their	proximity	to	cam-
pus,	and	availability	to	come	to	campus	to	

Figure	2	

Employee Participants
Male 5 Black 1 Leadership 4 Current Parents 2
Female 3 Asian 0 Middle Management 4 Parents of Alumni 2
Total 8 White 7 Tenure 1-36 years Alumni 2

Alumni Participants
Male 5 Black 1 Proximate to Campus 5 Current Parents 2
Female 6 Asian 1 Out-of-State 6 Parents of Alumni 0
Total 11 White 9 Ages 27-60

 Alumni Focus Group 1
Male 2 Engaged* 3 Proximate to Campus 6 Current Parents 6
Female 4 No-engagement3 Out-of-State 0 Parents of Alumni 0
Total 6 Ages 27-60

Alumni Focus Group 2
Male 4 Engaged* 3 Proximate to Campus 5 Current Parents 1
Female 1 No-engagement3 Out-of-State 0 Parents of Alumni 0
Total 5 Ages 27-60

* Engagement defined as having volunteered and/or given a gift in the last 5 years.
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participate	on	a	designated	date	at	desig-
nated	 times,	 making	 these	 participants	
also	a	sample	of	convenience,	which	pre-
sents	limitations.		

Alumni	participants	represented	an	array	
of	 ages	 (27-60)	 and	 tracked	 levels	 of	
alumni	 donor	 and	 volunteer	 behaviors.	
Participants	were	composed	of	50%	indi-
viduals	 who	 have	 volunteered	 and/or	
given	 a	 gift	 in	 the	 last	 5	 years,	 and	 50%	
who	 have	 not.	 	 Criteria	 for	 alumni	 inclu-
sion	in	the	study	included	being	a	graduate	
of	SCP;	individuals	who	attended	SCP	but	
did	not	graduate	were	excluded	from	the	
study.	 SCP’s	 internal	 database,	 which	 in-
cludes	 current	 information	 about	
prospective	 participants'	 physical	 and	
email	addresses	and	alumni	status/partic-
ipation	 served	 as	 the	 resource	 for	
determining	eligibility.		Selection	of	partic-
ipants	was	equitable	in	that	no	one	gender	
or	ethnic	group	was	targeted	in	the	selec-
tion	process.	The	study	recruited	an	equal	
number	 of	male	 and	 female	 participants.	
In	 addition,	 the	 composition	 of	 partici-
pants	 included	 an	 average	 of	 1	
administrator	for	every	2.6	alumni.	The	se-
lection	of	the	sample	is	the	most	significant	
limitation	 of	 the	 study.	 A	 purposive	 con-
venience	sample	such	as	this	substantially	
limits	the	internal	validity	of	the	study,	as	
the	 alumni	who	were	 selected	 and	 inter-
viewed	are	not	fully	representative	of	the	
greater	 population	 of	 8000+	 SCP	 alumni.	
In	 addition,	 those	who	 agreed	 to	 partici-
pate	 in	 the	 study	may	possess	 traits	 that	

are	not	representative	of	the	general	SCP	
alumni	 constituency,	 such	 as	 a	 desire	 to	
positively	represent	and	display	deference	
to	SCP.		

On	my	behalf,	an	administrator	 from	SCP	
emailed	 prospective	 participants	 who	 fit	
these	characteristics,	(using	an	email	tem-
plate	 I	 provided)	 inviting	 them	 to	
participate	 in	 the	 study.	 Those	 who	 re-
sponded	were	then	contacted	via	email	by	
me,	in	order	to	coordinate	their	participa-
tion	in	the	research.	In-person	interviews		
and	the	 focus	groups	took	place	on	SCP’s	
campus,	in	a	private	conference	room	that	
the	 school	 reserved	 for	 this	 purpose.	
Those	 who	 lived	 in	 other	 states	 were	
asked	 to	 engage	 in	 an	 interview	via	 tele-
phone	 or	 FaceTime.	 Interview	 and	 focus	
group	 participants	 did	 not	 receive	 re-
numeration	 for	 their	 participation,	 and	 I	
informed	all	participants	that	their	identi-
ties	and	the	identity	of	the	school	would	be	
kept	 anonymous	 in	 the	written	 report	 of	
the	study.	Subjects	were	also	advised	that	
interviews	and	focus	groups	would	be	rec-
orded	for	the	purpose	of	future	analyses.			

Interviews	 lasted	 for	 thirty	 to	 forty	
minutes	and	included	34	questions.	Focus	
groups	lasted	one	hour,	included	the	same	
questions,	and	were	also	recorded.	 Inter-
view	 protocols	 were	 built	 around	 the	
aforementioned	 theoretical	 frameworks,	
in	an	effort	to	tease	out	the	ways	in	which	
concepts	 of	 identity,	 belongingness,	 and	
community	 played	 a	 role	 in	 the	 experi-
ences	 of	 alumni	 and	 perceptions	 of	
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employees	 about	 the	 alumni	 experience.	
General	categories	for	questions	were:	so-
cial	 identity/belongingness	 (40%);	
communities	of	practice	 (30%);	and	gen-
eral	alumni	engagement	(30%).	Questions	
for	alumni	and	employees	were	the	same,	
but	 worded	 appropriately	 for	 each	 audi-
ence.	 Sample	 questions	 included	
(Appendix	D):	

• How	would	you	describe	overall	alumni	
engagement	at	SCP?	

• Tell	 me	 about	 a	 time	 when	 you	 have	
witnessed	 the	 SCP	 alumni	 community	
come	together	in	order	to	solve	a	prob-
lem,	 accomplish	 a	 goal,	 or	 share	
valuable	knowledge?		

• What	 do	 you	 believe	 would	 inspire	
alumni	 the	most	 to	 give	 to	 a	 financial	
gift	of	any	size	to	SCP?		

• Tell	me	about	a	time	when	SCP	publicly	
failed	 at	 something.	 How	 did	 you	 feel	
that	moment	reflected	upon	you,	as	an	
alumnus/a?	

• How	did	you	feel	that	those	moment	re-
flected	upon	SCP	at	large?	

• Tell	me	about	ways	in	which	your	team	
promotes	 a	 sense	 of	 belonging	 within	
the	SCP	alumni	community.		

Analytic Memos   
Analytic	memos	 (Appendix	F)	were	writ-
ten	 amidst	 the	 processes	 of	 conducting	
interviews	and	focus	groups,	in	an	effort	to	

engage	in	reflective	practice	about	the	or-
ganizational	 context	 and	 the	 stakeholder	
experience.	Reflecting	upon	my	conversa-
tions	with	SCP	administrators	and	alumni	
in	these	memos	promoted	learning	and	in-
trospection,	and	inspired	critical	thinking	
and	questioning	about	the	purpose	of	the	
research	 and	 the	 conceptual	 frameworks	
guiding	my	investigation.		Analytic	memos	
were	 later	 referenced	 on	 multiple	 occa-
sions,	 supporting	 the	 construction	 of	my	
codebook	and	concept-clustered	matrices	
which	were	instrumental	in	my	analysis	of	
stakeholder	interviews.	These	memos	also	
nurtured	 iterative	 processes	 of	 revisiting	
interview	protocols,	identifying	emergent	
themes	and	patterns	amongst	interviewee	
responses,	and	promoting	an	overall	focus	
on	developing	a	deeper	understanding	of	
the	unique	context	of	SCP.			

Listening Tour  
Once	all	of	the	interviews	and	focus	groups	
were	complete,	I	transcribed	them	using	a	
password	protected	educational	software.	
In	 conjunction	 with	 these	 transcriptions	
and	 any	 notes	 I	 took	 during	 the	 actual	
meetings,	 I	 listened	 to	 each	 interview	
twice	through,	and	then	began	curating	a	
list	of	key	themes	and	patterns	which	were	
emergent.	The	transcription	software	I	uti-
lized	 also	 provided	 a	 list	 of	 summary	
keywords--words	 that	 emerged	 with	
higher	 frequency—which	 aided	 in	 my	
identification	of	recurrent	concepts	which	
connected	to	my	study’s	conceptual	frame-
works	(Appendix	G).		
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Matrices & Codebook   
After	listening	to	the	interviews	and	focus	
groups	twice,	and	reviewing	my	list	of	key	
themes,	 patterns,	 and	 recurrent	words,	 I	
created	a	template	for	my	codebook	and	a	
concept-clustered	matrix,	which	I	then	ap-
plied	to	each	interview	and	focus	group,	as	
I	listened	to	the	recordings	again.	The	ma-
trices	 served	 as	 a	 powerful	 coding	 tool,	
providing	a	place	for	me	to	gather	quotes	
from	 interviewees	 which	 further	 illumi-
nated	the	ways	in	which	my	conversations	
with	 stakeholders	 connected	 back	 to	my	
conceptual	frameworks	and	my	key	prob-
lem	of	 practice.	 They	 also	 allowed	me	 to	
see	where	there	were	gaps	and	inconsist-
encies	within	 the	 data.	 I	 built	my	matrix	
template	and	codebook	around	the	follow-
ing	 core	 concepts:	 alumni	 engagement,	
core	 values,	 community,	 and	 culture,	
social	 identity/belongingness,	 mean-
ingful	 shared	 practices,	 and	
stories/narratives.	 In	 each	 individual	
matrix,	I	worked	to	distill	themes	from	my	
conversations	with	stakeholders	that	were	
illustrative	 of	 my	 three	 central	 research	
questions:	 How	 do	 personal	 and	 social	
identity	 shape	 forms	 of	 alumni	 engage-
ment?	;	How	do	different	forms	of	alumni	
engagement	foster	a	sense	of	belonging?	;	
and	What	 can	 independent	 schools	do	 to	
provide	 more	 meaningful	 and	 impactful	
forms	 of	 alumni	 engagement?	 	 For	 in-
stance,	 the	 theme	 of	 the	 power	 of	
mentoring	 between	 alumni	 and	 students	
was	 clearly	 portrayed	 in	 one	 school	 ad-
ministrator’s	 interview.	 Sharing	 a	 story	

about	 meaningful	 interactions	 between	
students	and	alumni,	she	said,	“One	of	our	
teachers	 took	 a	 group	 of	 journalism	 stu-
dents	 to	 New	 York	 City	 to	 meet	 alumni	
who	are	working	in	the	field	of	journalism-
-and	it	was	phenomenal	for	the	students--	
they	all	had	to	write	a	story	about	the	peo-
ple	 that	 they	 met.	 And	 then	 the	 alumni	
loved	 it.”	 	 Once	 a	matrix	was	 created	 for	
each	 interviewee	and	focus	group,	all	 the	
matrices	 were	 examined	 collectively,	 in	
order	to	best	understand	the	most	preva-
lent	 themes,	 highlighted	 in	my	 codebook	
(Appendix	H).	These	themes,	and	the	most	
representative	 quotes,	 were	 coalesced	
into	two	master	matrices—one	for	alumni	
and	one	for	employees--	(Appendix	I)	re-
flecting	 key	 elements	 of	 my	 conceptual	
frameworks	 of	 social	 identity	 theory	 and	
communities	of	practice	theory.		

Document/Media Analysis   
In	order	to	draw	upon	additional	sources	
of	evidence	in	my	investigation	of	the	phe-
nomenon	of	disengagement	of	SCP	alumni,	
I	 read,	 analyzed,	 and	 interpreted	 various	
social,	 digital	 and	print	 SCP	media,	 along	
with	 pre-existing	 SCP	 data	 about	 giving	
and	alumni	engagement	tools	and	behav-
iors.		This	involved	cataloging	both	content	
and	thematic	traits	of	documents	and	web-
sites	 into	 a	 document	 analysis	 table,	 and	
served	 to	 better	 ground	 my	 qualitative	
methods	in	the	context	of	SCP	as	pertains	
to	 the	 problem	 of	 practice	 being	 investi-
gated	 (Appendix	 J).	 	 In	 addition	 to	
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providing	 contextual	 richness,	 the	 docu-
ments,	 media,	 and	 websites	 were	
particularly	 useful	 in	 my	 post-interview	
reflective	 practice.	 In	 that	 regard,	 I	 used	
data	culled	from	these	sources	to	help	in-
form	 my	 interview	 data,	 and	 vice	 versa.		
My	review	of	documents,	media,	and	web-
sites	 prompted	new	 lines	 of	 inquiry,	 and	
was	instrumental	in	refining	concepts	and	
themes	which	I	had	unearthed	through	the	
interview	 and	 codebook/matrix-creation	
processes.			

Findings  

Overview of Findings 
Findings	in	this	study	surfaced	around	the	
following	 core	 concepts:	 alumni	 engage-
ment;	 core	 values,	 community,	 and	
culture;	social	identity	and	belongingness,	
meaningful	 shared	 practices;	 and	 sto-
ries/narratives.	

Limited Forms of Alumni Engagement   
Alumni	 engagement	 in	 this	 study	 is	 de-
fined	 as	 a	 group	 of	 behaviors	 in	 which	
alumni:	 dedicate	 their	 time	 to	 their	 alma	
mater,	 donate	 their	 talents	 to	 their	 alma	
mater,	make	a	 financial	gift	 to	 their	alma	
mater,	and/or	interact	with	fellow	alumni	
in	ways	which	 enhance	 the	 alma	mater’s	
networks	of	collaboration	and/or	commu-
nity.	Analysis	of	the	collected	data	reveals	
some	 inconsistencies	 amongst	 stake-
holder	attitudes	about	alumni	engagement	

across	these	four	categories.	A	2017	inter-
nal	SCP	report	(Appendix	A)	characterized	
the	 alumni	 program	 as	 “in	 its	 infancy	
stage”	and	“underutilized	in	advancing	the	
mission	of	the	school.”		One	current	admin-
istrative	 leader	 in	the	development	office	
described	 SCP’s	 alumni	 engagement	 as	
“very	 limited,”	 while	 another	 said	 “we	
have	no	alumni	engagement	program.”	In	
reflecting	 generally	 upon	 alumni	 engage-
ment,	 alumni	 used	 words	 like	 “spotty”,	
“skewed	 toward	 local	 alums”,	 lacking	 in	
“rhyme	 or	 reason”,	 “on	 a	 scale	 of	 one	 to	
ten,	 it’s	maybe	 like	 a	 one	 or	 a	 two”,	 and	
“outreach	 from	 the	 school	 is	 pretty	
low…it’s	usually	for	you	to	donate.”			There	
was	 clear	 consensus	 amongst	 stakehold-
ers	 in	 both	 the	 employee	 and	 alumni	
cohorts	 that	 the	 primary	 modality	 of	
alumni	 engagement	 at	 SCP	 is	 currently	
event	 participation.	 In	 2018-19,	 the	
Alumni	 Director	 managed	 ten	 distinct	
events	 in	 six	major	 cities,	with	 a	 total	 of	
1410	alumni	registrants	recorded,	reflect-
ing	 17%	 of	 the	 alumni	 constituency	
(Appendix	 E).	 	 Alumni	 made	 statements	
such	 as,	 “The	 primary	 mode	 of	 engage-
ment	for	alumni	is	alumni	events…I	think	
engagement	 is	 so-so.”	When	 asked	 about	
alumni	 engagement,	 multiple	 employees	
focused	 their	 comments	 primarily	 on	
event	attendance:	“Our	New	York	City	re-
union	in	terms	of	turnout,	I	mean,	we	have	
turned	people	away.	Wow…we	had	a	sub-
stantial	 waiting	 list	 for	 that.”	 Another	
remarked	on	feelings	of	positive	momen-
tum	related	to	alumni	events:	“I	think	that	



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 21	

gathering	people	at	the	alumni	receptions	
in	 the	 cities	 and	working	 toward	 getting	
even	 more	 people	 back	 on	 campus	 for	
homecoming	and	reunion	weekends--I	im-
agine	it’s	paid	off.	I	don’t	have	the	data	to	
back	 that	 up.	 But	 it	 just	 feels	 like,	 you	
know,	it’s	growing.”		

While	the	school’s	busy	annual	calendar	of	
regional	alumni	social	events	in	cities	with	
higher	 SCP	 alumni	 concentrations	 was	
lauded	 by	 some	 stakeholders	 for	 recent	
growth	 in	attendance,	other	stakeholders	
were	 skeptical	 of	 the	 lasting	 value	 that	
these	social	events	 truly	provided	 the	at-
tendees,	 the	 institution,	 and	 the	 alumni	
body	at	large.		The	key	employees	involved	
in	 designing	 and	 executing	 alumni	 rela-
tions	 engagement	 programming	 and	
strategy	 expressed	 dissimilar	 opinions	
about	 the	 value	 of	 alumni	 events.	 	 For	
some,	high	attendance	was	 illustrative	of	
value.	 For	 others,	 an	 inherent	 lack	 of	
deeper	 meaning	 and	 purpose	 associated	
with	 events	 diminished	 their	 value.	 	 One	
school	leader	wondered,	“We	just	had	fifty	
alumni	come	to	a	happy	hour.	You	know,	I	
still	 don’t	 know	 if	 any	 good	 came	 out	 of	
that.	 I	really	don’t.”	 	Another	said,	“There	
are	a	lot	of	people	whose	success	is	deter-
mined	 by	 how	 many	 people	 you	 get	 to	
events.	It’s	not,	did	they	have	a	good	time?	
Did	 they	 feel	 more	 connected,	 did	 they	
make	some	connection	that	will	help	them	
in	the	future?	Did	they	walk	away	with	an-
ything?”		

Alumni	 also	 displayed	 mixed	 feelings	
about	events.	While	some	expressed	disin-
terest--“In	all	honesty,	if	I	asked	my	alumni	
friends	 if	 they	wanted	 to	 go	 to	 an	 event,	
they’d	say	no,”--	others	noted	logistical	ob-
stacles:	 “There	 are	 some	 regional	 events	
that	happen,	but	they	are	often	on	a	week	
night--getting	 there	 is	 not	 super	 easy.”		
Other	alumni	described	events	as	“a	great	
way	to	network,	and,	you	know,	see	where	
life	has	taken	other	people”.	 	School	mes-
saging	 around	 alumni	 engagement	
prioritized	 event	 attendance,	 listing	 it	 as	
the	number	one	way	 to	 “get	 involved”	as	
an	alumnus/a	of	SCP.	The	primary	calls	to	
action	 on	 SCP’s	 alumni	website	 included,	
“Join	fellow	alumni	and	faculty	at	reunions	
and	receptions”	and	“Stay	engaged	 in	 the	
life	 of	 the	 school	 by	 attending	 events	 on	
campus.”	 	 The	 tradition	 of	 including	 be-
loved	 faculty	 into	 alumni	 events	 was	
roundly	praised,	and	seen	as	a	very	moti-
vating	 and	 deeply	 meaningful	 aspect	 of	
these	 gatherings:	 “Most	 people	 come	 to	
alumni	 events	 to	 see	 what	 teachers	 are	
coming.	They	want	to	see	their	old	teach-
ers.”	 	 While	 some	 alumni	 professed	
appreciation	for	the	opportunity	to	profes-
sionally	network	at	alumni	events,	others	
admitted	 that	 if	 given	 the	 opportunity,	
they	and	their	SCP	friends	would	prefer	to	
just	spend	time	together	on	their	own	and	
use	platforms	such	as	LinkedIn	to	facilitate	
networking.		
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Alumni	 engagement	 programming	which	
solicits	 alumni	 gifts	 of	 talent	 to	 SCP	 ap-
peared	to	be	limited	in	scope	and	lacking	
in	formal	programming	and	structure.		Ac-
tivities	 such	 as	 a	 former	 program	 run	
through	 the	 school’s	 civic	 institute,	 occa-
sional	alumni	guest	speakers,	and	a	recent	
journalism	 field	 trip	 collaboration	 be-
tween	 SCP	 faculty	 and	 alumni	 were	 all	
mentioned	as	examples	of	alumni	sharing	
talents	 with	 the	 SCP	 student	 body.	 This	
limited	menu	of	alumni	talent	engagement	
accurately	 reflected	 some	 stakeholders’	
expressions	 that	 broader	 concepts	 of	
alumni	 engagement	 are	 “untapped”	 and	
instead	 remain	 localized	 around	 social	
events.	Alumni	expressed	marked	enthusi-
asm	about	giving	talent	or	expertise	back	
to	SCP,	but	seemed	unclear	on	how	to	pur-
sue	that	avenue	of	alumni	engagement.			

At	3.3%	alumni	participation	in	the	annual	
fund,	 a	 rate	 6	%	 below	 the	 independent	
school	 national	 average	 (NAIS,	 2019),	
SCP’s	record	of	financial	gifts	from	
alumni	 demonstrates	 low	 donor	
engagement	 for	 the	 last	 several	
years.	 However,	 recent	 data	 did	
reveal	steady	growth	over	the	last	
few	years	in	overall	dollars	given	
to	SCP	from	alumni,	indicating	the	
acquisition	of	some	major	individ-
ual	 alumni	 gifts.	 Some	 employee	
stakeholders	 were	 mystified	 by	
chronic	low	alumni	donor	partici-
pation,	 while	 others	 pointed	

directly	to	SCP’s	longstanding	impersonal	
solicitation	 techniques,	 which	 lacked	 the	
foundation	 of	 a	 broader	 alumni	 engage-
ment	 program:	 “So	 we	 have	 no	 alumni	
engagement	 program,	 but	we’re	 continu-
ally	 soliciting	 alumni	over	 and	over--that	
doesn’t	work	 so	well.	And	not	 a	 targeted	
solicitation--a	general	annual	fund	appeal	
that	 says,	 ‘Dear	 Alumni’.”	 	 	 Some	 alumni	
echoed	 this	 critique	with	 cynicism	 about	
the	school	“always	asking	for	money”	and	
having	 limited	 alumni	 outreach	 that	 is	
“usually	 for	 you	 to	 donate.”	 	 Gifts	 from	
alumni	also	appear	to	be	mitigated	by	the	
alumni	perception	that	SCP	is	“flush	with	
money”	and	the	fact	that	alumni	sought	to	
“put	money	into	causes	that	are	more	rel-
evant	 to	 me	 at	 this	 point	 in	 my	 life.”		
Alumni	 also	 offered	 feedback	 related	 to	
the	 potential	 power	 of	 SCP’s	 storytelling	
for	more	targeted	gift	solicitation;	stories	
about	 former	 faculty,	 scholarship	 suc-
cesses,	 and	 specific	 areas	 of	 institutional	

Figure	3	

Alumni Average Facebook Engagements over 300 Posts

School-Sponsored Alumni Facebook Page Engagements*
Event-related Posts 14
Nostalgia/Former Faculty Related Posts 114
Overall average 32

Alumni-Managed Alumni Facebook Page Engagements*
Event-related Posts 8
Nostalgia/Former Faculty Related Posts 289
Overall average 66

* Engagement defined as a like, comment, or share.
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need	were	narratives	alumni	said	could	in-
spire	them	to	make	a	financial	gift	to	SCP.	

Interaction	 with	 fellow	 alumni	 in	 ways	
which	enhance	SCP’s	networks	of	collabo-
ration	 and/or	 community	 were	
impressive	in	certain	domains,	such	as	so-
cial	 media.	 SCP	 boasts	 two	 alumni	
Facebook	pages	(one	school-managed,	one	
alumni-managed),	 which	 have	 engage-
ment	 of	 21%	and	25%,	 respectively.	 The	
school	 site,	with	 an	 average	of	 five	posts	
per	 week,	 was	 a	 celebration	 of	 alumni.	
Births,	weddings,	 businesses,	 alumni	 vis-
its,	and	upcoming	events	were	all	met	with	
reactions	 from	 stakeholders.	 This	 plat-
form	for	engagement	positively	facilitates	
virtual	dialogue	between	alumni	and	SCP	
as	well	as	amongst	alumni;	 the	page	also	
hosts	 seven	 alumni	 affinity	 groups,	 rang-
ing	from	arts,	to	athletics,	to	class	years.			

On	the	school-managed	site,	 the	most	re-
cent	 300	 posts	 demonstrated	 an	 average	
of	114	engagements	for	nostalgic	posts	as-
sociated	 with	 former	 faculty	 versus	 an	
average	of	14	engagements	for	posts	asso-
ciated	 with	 school-sponsored	 alumni	
events.	 	 The	 alumni-managed	 Facebook	
page	 is	 a	 private	 group,	 managed	 by	
alumni,	 for	 alumni.	 Despite	 having	 more	
followers	than	the	school-sponsored	page,	
posts	are	much	less	frequent	but	offer	an	
authentic	 platform	 for	 alumni	 voices	 in-
cluding	promotion	of	businesses,	photos	of	
alumni	 get-togethers,	 nostalgic	 memory-
sharing,	 dissemination	 of	 obituaries,	 and	
requests	 for	 fundraising	 support	 for	 the	

personal	 initiatives	 of	 alumni.	 	 On	 the	
alumni-managed	 Facebook	 page,	 the	 last	
300	posts	demonstrated	an	average	of	289	
engagements	 for	 nostalgic	 posts	 associ-
ated	with	former	faculty,	and	an	average	of	
8	 engagements	 for	 posts	 associated	with	
school-sponsored	 alumni	 events.	 Overall	
engagement	in	the	last	300	posts	for	each	
site	 indicated	 an	 average	 of	 32	 engage-
ments	 per	 post	 on	 the	 school-sponsored	
site,	and	66	engagements	per	post	on	the	
alumni-managed	site.		Notably,	across	the	
four	 domains	 of	 alumni	 engagement,	
themes	of	belonging	were	most	apparently	
expressed	in	this	last	category	of	 interac-
tion	 with	 fellow	 alumni	 in	 ways	 which	
enhance	SCP’s	networks	on	 social	media.	
Words	like	“You	know	you	went	to	SCP	if”,	
“our	 SCP	 community”,	 “special	 relation-
ships”,	 “connection”,	 “memories”,	 	 and	
“SCP	lifer”	were	illustrative	of	this.		

Powerful Core Values, Community & 
Culture 
Regardless	of	age,	 location,	or	number	of	
layers	of	identity,	academic	excellence	was	
consistently	expressed	as	the	leading	core	
value	of	the	SCP	alumni	who	participated	
in	this	study.	Scaffolded	upon	academic	ex-
cellence	were	 the	neighboring	constructs	
of	 success,	 intelligence,	 and	 work	 ethic.	
When	asked	about	the	core	values	of	SCP,	
one	graduate	summed	up	 the	 remarks	of	
many:	“Work	ethic—you	have	to	be	smart	
and	work	hard	to	go	to	SCP”,	while	another	
said	 “Academic	 excellence	 first	 and	 fore-
most--the	school	prides	itself	on	being	the	
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best	of	the	best.”	 	Employee	stakeholders	
as	 a	 group	 gravitated	 more	 toward	 core	
values	of	citizenship,	character,	and	empa-
thy,	 sharing	 reflections	 such	 as	 “having	
strong	character	and	being	good	citizens”	
and	“to	have	empathy	towards	others’	per-
spectives”.	 	 The	 value	 of	 academic	
excellence	 was	 also	 powerfully	 resonant	
throughout	 documents	 and	media	 collat-
eral,	 with	 repeated	 use	 of	 words	 like	
“excellence”,	 “most	 challenging	 high	
schools	 list”,	 and	 “challenging	 academic	
experience”	(Appendix	C).		Alumni	also	ex-
pressed	 feelings	 of	 pride	 and	 positive	
affiliation	in	relation	to	SCP’s	core	value	of	
academic	excellence;	there	was	an	explicit	
prestige	associated	with	having	graduated	
from	 an	 institution	 that	 prized	 academic	
excellence.	Every	alumnus/a	who	partici-
pated	 in	 this	 study	 expressed	 pride	 for	
their	affiliation	with	SCP.	For	some	alumni	
it	 was	 “intense	 pride”	 and	 “tremendous	
pride”;	 even	 alumni	 stakeholders	 who	
lived	 far	 from	 campus	 and/or	 had	 anger	
about	some	of	their	experiences	with	SCP	
still	claimed	to	“feel	very	proud”	to	be	an	
alumnus/a	of	SCP.	

Interwoven	 throughout	 the	 data,	 in	 both	
employee	 and	 alumni	 stakeholder	 re-
sponses,	there	was	also	a	deep	and	abiding	
appreciation	for	the	value	of	the	SCP	com-
munity.	If	academic	excellence	emerged	as	
the	 overarching	 intellectual	 value,	 com-
munity	emerged	from	all	of	the	data	as	the	
value	 at	 the	 heart	 of	 all	 of	 SCP.	Whether	

sustained	through	longtime	alumni	friend-
ships,	 nostalgic	 reminiscence	 about	
revered	faculty,	or	multigenerational	com-
mitment	 to	SCP,	a	 love	of	 the	community	
(either	in	its	gestalt	or	via	a	subset	thereof)	
was	unambiguous.	This	even	rang	true	for	
stakeholders	who	had	become	overtly	dis-
enchanted	 with	 SCP	 in	 other	 ways.	
Grudges	about	past	administrative	lapses,	
foolhardy	leadership	stints,	and	clumsy	so-
licitations	 were	 all	 overshadowed	 by	 a	
love	of	the	SCP	community.		

Nestled	within	 the	construct	of	SCP	com-
munity	 were	 more	 specific	 expressed	
socio-cultural	 assets.	 Many	 alumni	 de-
scribed	how	enduring	relationships	and	a	
close-knit	 family	 feeling	 engendered	 by	
membership	 within	 the	 SCP	 community	
continue	to	nourish	them	in	their	interper-
sonal	 lives,	 long	after	graduation.	Several	
alumni	 described	 SCP	 relationships	 with	
alumni	 friends	 and	 former	 teachers	 as	
“lifelong”	and	“family.”	Feeling	“cared	for”,	
“close	with,”	and	“at	home”	were	all	quali-
ties	 associated	 with	 SCP	 alumni	
reflections,	and	special	relationships	built	
at	 SCP	 by	 alumni.	 For	 some	 alumni,	 the	
feelings	derived	from	these	lasting	SCP	re-
lationships	 helps	 cultivate	 an	 enduring	
affection	 for	 the	 institution	 at	 large.	 One	
alumnus	 vividly	 described	 the	 way	 in	
which	 his	 nearly	 40-year	 close	 relation-
ship	with	one	of	his	SCP	teachers	casts	“a	
glow	from	her	that	is	reflected	back	on	the	
school.”		Another	described	how	the	rich-
ness	 of	 her	 SCP	 relationships	 remains	
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unparalleled	 27	 years	 after	 graduating;	
“There	is	a	connection	that	I’ve	never	rep-
licated	anywhere	else.”		

Social Identity & Belongingness:     
Layers, Lifers and Geography   
Alumni	who	possessed	additional	layers	of	
identity	at	SCP	(parent,	coach,	employee)	
along	with	 alumni	who	 attended	 SCP	 for	
13	years	(“lifers”)	demonstrated	the	most	
powerful	 identification	 with	 SCP.	 The	
more	roles	alumni	had	in	association	with	
the	 school,	 and/or	 the	 longer	 they	 at-
tended,	 the	 greater	 the	 sense	 of	
“intertwinement”	 with	 the	 organization	
(Foote,	 1951).	 One	 alumnus	 reflected	
upon	having	more	 than	one	 identity,	 and	
also	being	a	lifer	at	SCP:	“when	you	tabu-
late	all	of	those	vantage	points,	it	makes	for	
a	rich	understanding	of	the	school…all	the	
identities	 are	 intertwined…I	 feel	 like	
they’re	all	rolled	up	into	one.”		Employees	
echoed	this	observation	about	alumni	who	
possessed	additional	SCP	identities	behav-
ing	in	ways	that	were	illustrative	of	a	deep	
connection.		One	remarked	that	“We	have	
so	many	alumni	who	come	back	and	have	
their	kids	here…the	number	of	legacy	fam-
ilies	is	huge,”	while	another	commented	on	
the	fact	that	SCP	legacy	family	events	were	
popular	opportunities	for	alumni	“to	come	
together	and…celebrat[e]	identity.”		Status	
was	also	associated	with	possessing	multi-
ple	 SCP	 identities	 and	being	 an	SCP	 lifer.	
Those	who	were	employees/alumni,	lifers,	
and/or	part	of	a	legacy	family	were	classi-
fied	 as	 “special”	 and	 “a	 big	 deal”	 in	

interviews,	 focus	 groups,	 and	 school	me-
dia.	 The	 value	 proposition	 of	 recreating	
the	 SCP	 experience	 for	 the	 children	 of	
alumni	 was	 also	 notably	 high.	 Several	
alumni	 mentioned	 their	 aspirations	 to	
send	 their	 children	 to	 SCP,	 while	 others	
shared	stories	about	electively	 relocating	
far	 distances	 back	 to	 the	 region	 due	 to	
their	desire	to	enroll	their	children	at	their	
alma	 mater.	 	 Employees	 also	 referenced	
“so	many	cases	of	[alumni]	who	move	back	
here	 to	 have	 their	 kids	 to	 go	 to	 school	
where	 they	 went.”	 	 Feelings	 of	 identity	
were	powerful	for	SCP	lifers.	One	shared,	
“Your	 identity	 is	 with	 those	 people	 that	
you	spent	all	those	hours	with…every	sin-
gle	day,	 for	years…that’s	part	of	who	you	
are.”	

For	alumni	who	did	not	live	in	proximity	to	
campus,	 the	ranking	of	 their	SCP	 identity	
into	their	overall	concept	of	self	was	typi-
cally	 much	 less	 significant.	 Geographic	
distance	 fostered	 feelings	 of	 detachment,	
and	self-identification	as	an	“outsider”	or	
being	“on	the	edges”	of	the	alumni	commu-
nity.		Some	of	these	stakeholders	looked	to	
the	alumni	office,	and/or	to	SCP	social	me-
dia	 and	 professional	 digital	 networking	
outlets	to	help	bridge	their	sense	of	disen-
gagement.	 When	 reunions	 and	 long-
distance	correspondences	with	SCP	didn’t	
meet	 their	 expectations,	 alumni	 men-
tioned	 feeling	 “disconnected”	 and	
“distant”	 from	 the	 organization,	 and	
“stop[ing]	paying	attention.”	One	non-local	
alumna	observed	that	“the	people	who	are	
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local	get	a	lot	more	engagement	from	SCP”	
while	another	said,	“The	fact	that	I	went	to	
SCP	doesn’t	 really	 inform	my	 identity	 to-
day,	 in	 my	 everyday	 life…I	 don’t	 live	
there.”	 	 	 Some	 non-local	 alumni	 also	 al-
luded	to	a	 lack	of	relevance	of	one’s	high	
school	 alma	 mater,	 particularly	 if	 you	
didn’t	 live	 near	 the	 organization;	 “Once	
you	 graduate	 from	 college	 I	 don’t	 know	
that	 where	 you	 went	 to	 high	 school	 is	
looked	at	when	you’re	applying	for	jobs—
especially	 if	 you’re	 not	 living	 near	 SCP”.	
Employees,	 conversely,	 did	 not	 express	
any	concerns	or	observations	about	effec-
tively	 engaging	 geographically	 distant	
alumni.	Rather,	several	commented	on	the	
ways	 in	 which	 the	 school	 has	 positively	
nourished	 connections	 with	 alumni	 in	
other	cities	through	regional	events.	

A Desire for Outlets of Meaningful 
Shared Practice   
Despite	very	limited	school-sponsored	op-
portunities,	alumni	expressed	willingness,	
curiosity,	and	occasional	eagerness	to	en-
gage	 in	 meaningful	 shared	 community	
practices,	 whether	 through	 service	 pro-
jects,	 mentoring,	 professional	
collaboration,	 athletics,	 or	 the	 arts.	 Com-
munities	 of	 practice	 were	 emergent	
amongst	regional	alumni	who	shared	busi-
ness	 affinities;	 one	 group	 arranged	 their	
own	 regular	 professional	 networking	
meetings	with	the	explicit	purpose	of	“con-
tinu[ing]	 to	 develop	 in	 our	 professional	
careers,	and	helping	each	other	grow	in	all	
aspects	of	our	 lives.”	 	Sharing	knowledge	

and	 expertise	 was	 something	 alumni	
wished	to	have	more	opportunities	to	cap-
italize	 on,	 given	 the	 perceived	 strength	
and	value	of	the	SCP	alumni	community	at	
large.	 SCP’s	 LinkedIn	 group	was	 a	 digital	
space	where	some	alumni	claimed	to	seek	
out	 these	 resources,	 but	 the	more	mean-
ingful	 collaborations	 happened	 through	
alumnus/a-to-alumnus/a	professional	re-
ferrals	 and	 relations.	 Alumni	 referenced	
the	 implicit	worth	of	an	SCP	professional	
referral.		One	stated,	“You’re	more	trusting	
to	 do	 business	with	 an	 SCP	 alum,”	while	
another	 added,	 “We	 share	 a	 history	 that	
cannot	be	rivaled	by	someone	who	is	not	
from	that	background.”	

Opportunities	 to	 engage	 in	 community	
service	activities,	or	shared	social	 impact	
efforts	were	also	welcomed	by	alumni.	For	
some,	coming	together	to	engage	in	these	
kinds	of	meaningful	practices	with	an	al-
truistic	 mission	 or	 goal	 was	 more	
attractive	than	traditional	social	events:	“I	
would	 choose	 to	 give	 back	 at	 a	 service-
type	of	event	over	participating	in	a	social	
event.”		The	desire	to	engage	in	these	sorts	
of	 activities	 was	 not	 tied	 to	 one’s	 geo-
graphic	 proximity	 to	 campus.	 Alumni	
expressed	 a	 willingness	 to	 co-opt	 fellow	
alumni	in	their	region	to	galvanize	around	
meaningful	 endeavors.	 “If	 SCP	was	 doing	
something	worthwhile,	like	helping	people	
register	 to	 vote,	 or	 marching	 to	 bring	
awareness	to	a	social	cause	I	believe	in,	I’d	
be	 inclined	 to	get	 that	going	where	 I	 live	
too.”	
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Mentoring	was	the	most	favored	outlet	for	
shared	meaningful	 practice	 amongst	 SCP	
alumni.	 There	 was	 an	 overt	 enthusiasm	
about	 serving	 as	 a	 mentor	 to	 a	 younger	
alumnus/a,	 and/or	 adopting	 the	 role	 of	
mentee	with	a	more	seasoned	member	of	
the	alumni	community.	Wonderings	about	
the	 current	 lack	of	 formalized	mentoring	
programming	at	SCP	were	evident;	“I	think	
[mentoring]	is	something	that,	you	know,	
is	 really	 lacking	 in	 SCP	 alumni	 engage-
ment.”	 Despite	 the	 enthusiasm	 of	 alumni	
for	mentoring	 forms	 of	 engagement,	 em-
ployees	 were	 reticent	 to	 take	 on	 the	
concept	 due	 to	 challenges	 related	 to	 hu-
man	 resources	 and	 interdepartmental	
collaboration.		Concerns	about	the	quality	
control	of	mentor	onboarding,	the	bifurca-
tion	 of	mentoring	 solicitation	 efforts	 and	
fundraising	efforts,	and	a	lack	of	clarity	re-
garding	 whether	 an	 alumni	 mentoring	
program	should	be	managed	by	a	develop-
ment	officer	or	a	student	affairs	employee	
were	 all	 significant	 stumbling	 blocks	 ex-
pressed	by	SCP	staff.		Some	past	efforts	to	
more	 strategically	 and	 formally	 engage	
alumni	 in	 mentoring	 programming	
through	the	school’s	civic	center	were	now	
dormant	due	to	personnel	changes,	but	the	
occasional	 alumni	 guest	 speaker	 and	
alumni	 panel-style	 activities	were	 unilat-
erally	 praised	 for	 their	 direct	 positive	
impact	on	students.	“If	I'm	a	student,	and	
I'm	 being	 mentored	 by	 alumni,	 that's	
something	for	me	to	 look	up	to.	 I	can	see	
myself	 in	 her.”	 	 The	 capacity	 for	 alumni	
gifts	of	time	and	talent	through	mentoring	

to	bring	a	 focus	on	something	other	 than	
fundraising	 was	 also	 commended.	 “I've	
also	 seen	 alumni	 be	 asked	 to	 share	 their	
expertise	with	students	and	that	working	
really	well,	 because	 they	 feel	 like	 they're	
giving	without	having	to	sacrifice	money.”	

Connection through Storytelling 
Storytelling	 about	 alumni	 has	 only	 re-
cently	become	a	more	intentional	aspect	of	
SCP’s	efforts	to	connect	with	their	alumni.		
With	the	advent	of	relatively	new	formats	
for	storytelling,	such	as	social	media,	SCP’s	
communications	 team	 has	 avidly	 sought	
out	 ways	 to	 enhance	 and	 celebrate	 the	
alumni	narrative.	Stories	about	individual	
alumni--their	 professions,	 crafts,	 talents,	
and	“a-day-in-the-life”—find	a	broad	audi-
ence	on	SCP’s	social	media	channels,	and	
in	 the	 alumni	 magazine.	 	 Stories	 are	 re-
peated	 across	 formats,	 and	 highlight	 a	
range	 of	 SCP	 alumni;	 one	 employee	
shared,	“Not	a	week	goes	by	where	there's	
not	an	alumni	story	going	on.	And	it	could	
be	repeated.	You	know,	I'll	see	it	on	Face-
book.	 I'll	 see	 it	 on	 Instagram.	 I'll	 see	 it	
wherever.	And	that's	so	terrific.”		Employ-
ees	seemed	invigorated	by	the	fresh	voices	
that	 recent	 alumni	 profiles	 have	 brought	
forth	 into	 the	 alumni	 narrative,	 and	 the	
benefits	of	storytelling	were	perceived	as	
manifold,	 “sharing	 the	 story	 is	 a	 celebra-
tion	in	itself…because	a	lot	of	times	when	
we	reach	out	to	that	[alumnus/a],	they	are	
honored	and	happy	 to	 share	 their	 story.”		
This	format	for	sharing	alumni	stories	be-
tween	SCP	and	the	alumni	body	stands	in	
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contrast	 to	 some	 expressed	 alumni	 per-
ceptions	 of	 direct-mail-oriented	
interactions	 with	 their	 alma	 mater,	 fo-
cused	 on	 events	 and	 gift	 solicitation,	 not	
storytelling.	 	One	alumnus	shared	“I	can’t	
remember	 many	 points	 of	 contact	 from	
SCP.	Once	in	a	while	I	get	a	pamphlet	in	the	
mail	 with	 a	 request	 for	 a	 donation…and	
maybe	 notification	 of	 regional	 events	 in	
my	area.	But	that’s	all	I	can	think	of.”	 	In-
terestingly,	the	alumni	relations	personnel	
at	SCP	seem	to	have	less	of	a	hand	in	shap-
ing	 alumni	 stories;	 rather,	 it	 is	 the	
employees	in	the	communications	depart-
ment	who	appear	to	drive	the	generation,	
writing,	and	publishing	of	alumni	stories,	
with	alumni	employees	remaining	focused	
on	donor	solicitation	and	events.	

Nostalgia	played	a	key	role	in	the	SCP	nar-
rative	for	its	alumni.	Described	by	some	as	
“huge”	and	others	as	“iconic,”	the	folkloric	
chronicles	of	SCP	traditions,	former	teach-
ers,	 and	 student	 hijinks	 were	 all	 an	
essential	part	of	 the	gestalt	of	 the	shared	
SCP	alumni	experience.		Warm	and	humor-
ous	memories	of	time	spent	with	teachers	
and	friends	during	one’s	time	as	a	student,	
in	combination	with	the	celebration	of	dis-
tinctive	SCP	community	rituals,	comprised	
much	of	the	narrative	on	the	alumni-spon-
sored	 Facebook	 page.	 Resonance	 of	
certain	 particulars	 of	 SCP	 nostalgia	
emerged	across	a	variety	of	school	media,	
as	well	as	during	interviews.		Alumni	artic-
ulated	an	appreciation	for	the	genuineness	

of	 SCP	 narratives	which	 highlighted	 nos-
talgia,	 indicating	 its	 power	 in	 the	 overall	
alumni	discourse.	“Some	traditions	aren't	
there	 anymore.	 But	 I	 think	 you	 know,	
there's	that	overwhelming	sense	of	nostal-
gia	that’s	very	powerful	within	the	alumni	
group.	 And	 it's	 fun	 to	 have	 that	 shared	
sense	 of	 memory.”	 Alumni	 also	 com-
mented	 on	 the	 effect	 of	 more	 personal	
stories	in	motivating	them	to	act,	whether	
as	 a	 donor	 or	 a	 volunteer:	 “Hearing	 per-
sonal	 stories	 of	 people	 who	 have	 been	
helped	by	gifts	to	SCP	who	are	less	fortu-
nate--then	I	might	feel	more	compelled	to	
donate	or	volunteer.”		

Key Findings  

Finding 1 

SCP alumni with more than one SCP layer 

of identity demonstrate more salience with 

the organization, which enhances their 

sense of belonging and actively motivates 

them towards engagement behaviors. 

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

personal and social identity shape alumni 

engagement at SCP? 

Alumni	who	possessed	additional	layers	of	
identity	at	SCP	(parent,	coach,	employee)	
along	with	 alumni	who	 attended	 SCP	 for	
13	years	(“lifers”)	demonstrated	the	most	
powerful	 identification	 with	 SCP.	 The	
more	roles	alumni	had	in	association	with	
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the	 school,	 and/or	 the	 longer	 they	 at-
tended,	 the	greater	 the	 salience	 they	had	
with	the	organization.	In	this	context	sali-
ence	 is	 defined	as	 a	 strong	 expression	of	
one’s	 identity	 integration	 with	 the	 alma	
mater.	 Status	 was	 also	 associated	 with	
possessing	multiple	SCP	identities	and	be-
ing	an	SCP	 lifer.	Those	who	had	multiple	
identities	were	classified	as	“special”	in	in-
terviews,	focus	groups,	and	school	media,	
and	 personally	 expressed	 powerful	 feel-
ings	of	belonging.	

Finding 2 

The deep and lasting relationships of SCP 

alumni with faculty and fellow alumni ac-

tively enhance their feelings of community, 

belonging and psychological intertwine-

ment with SCP. This furthers their self-

identification with SCP and inspires en-

gagement. 

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

personal and social identity shape alumni 

engagement at SCP? 

Nestled	within	 the	construct	of	SCP	com-
munity	 were	 more	 specific	 expressed	
socio-cultural	 assets.	 Many	 alumni	 de-
scribed	how	enduring	relationships	and	a	
close-knit	 family	 feeling	 engendered	 by	
membership	 within	 the	 SCP	 community	
continue	to	nourish	them	in	their	interper-
sonal	 lives,	 long	after	graduation.	Several	
alumni	 described	 SCP	 relationships	 with	

alumni	 friends	 and	 former	 teachers	 as	
“lifelong”	 and	 “family.”	 Feeling	 cared	 for,	
“close”	with,	and	“at	home”	were	all	quali-
ties	 associated	 with	 SCP	 alumni	
reflections,	and	special	relationships	built	
at	 SCP	 by	 alumni.	 For	 some	 alumni,	 the	
feelings	derived	from	these	lasting	SCP	re-
lationships	 helps	 cultivate	 an	 enduring	
affection	for	the	institution	at	large,	and	in-
spires	ongoing	engagement	behaviors.		

	

Finding 3 

Regardless of positive or negative past or 

present feelings about SCP, alumni unilat-

erally express strong feelings of pride 

about being an SCP alumnus/a.  

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

personal and social identity shape alumni 

engagement at SCP? 

Every	alumnus/a	who	participated	in	this	
study	 expressed	 distinct	 pride	 for	 their	
alma	mater.	 For	 some	 alumni	 it	was	 “in-
tense	pride”	and	“tremendous	pride”;	even	
alumni	 stakeholders	 who	 lived	 far	 from	
campus	and/or	had	anger	about	 some	of	
their	experiences	with	SCP	still	claimed	to	
“feel	 very	 proud”	 to	 be	 an	 alumnus/a	 of	
SCP.	As	indicated	by	the	literature,	feelings	
of	 pride	 and	 perceptions	 of	 prestige	 in-
crease	 one’s	 social	 identification	 with	 a	
group.	Positive	social	 identification	nour-
ishes	 self-esteem,	 and	 motivates	 one’s	
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desire	to	be	affiliated	with	a	successful	or-
ganization.	

Finding 4 

SCP’s core value of academic excellence is 

a powerful driver of SCP alumni pride.  

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

personal and social identity shape alumni 

engagement at SCP? 

Regardless	of	age,	 location,	or	number	of	
layers	of	identity,	academic	excellence	was	
consistently	expressed	as	the	leading	core	
value	of	the	SCP	alumni	who	participated	
in	this	study.	Scaffolded	upon	academic	ex-
cellence	were	 the	neighboring	constructs	
of	 success,	 intelligence,	 and	 work	 ethic.	
Alumni	also	expressed	feelings	of	positive	
affiliation	in	relation	to	SCP’s	core	value	of	
academic	excellence;	there	was	an	explicit	
prestige	associated	with	having	graduated	
from	 an	 institution	 that	 prized	 academic	
excellence.	 	The	 literature	 illustrates	 that	
social	 identification	 with	 a	 winner	 posi-
tively	 impacts	 self-esteem	 and	motivates	
behaviors	which	enhance	affiliation	(Ash-
forth	&	Mael,	1989).		

Finding 5 

Alumni-oriented communications integrat-

ing personal stories and nostalgia on 

school-related media fuel feelings of be-

longingness and community for SCP 

alumni, and can motivate alumni towards 

engagement behaviors.  

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

different forms of alumni engagement 

shape a sense of belonging? 

Nostalgia	and	personal	stories	play	a	key	
role	in	the	SCP	narrative	for	its	alumni.	The	
folkloric	chronicles	of	SCP	traditions,	 for-
mer	teachers,	and	student	hijinks	were	all	
an	 essential	 part	 of	 the	 gestalt	 of	 the	 ex-
pressed	 SCP	 alumni	 experience.	
Resonance	 of	 certain	 particulars	 of	 SCP	
nostalgia	 emerged	 across	 a	 variety	 of	
school	media,	as	well	as	during	interviews,	
integrating	words	indicative	of	belonging-
ness.	 	 Alumni	 also	 articulated	 an	
appreciation	 for	 the	 genuineness	 of	 SCP	
narratives	 which	 highlighted	 personal	
alumni	stories	 in	 the	overall	discourse	of	
SCP.	 Alumni	 commented	 on	 the	 effect	 of	
more	personal	stories	in	motivating	them	
to	act,	whether	as	a	donor	or	a	volunteer.	

Finding 6 

Geography matters. SCP Alumni who are 

more physically distant from campus are 

less interested in engaging with SCP, and 

express a lack of incentive and connected-

ness. 

Correlated Key Research Question: How do 

personal and social identity shape alumni 

engagement at SCP? 



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 31	

For	alumni	who	do	not	live	in	proximity	to	
campus,	 the	ranking	of	 their	SCP	 identity	
into	their	overall	concept	of	self	was	typi-
cally	 much	 less	 significant	 than	 alumni	
living	in	proximity	to	campus.	Geographic	
distance	 fostered	 feelings	of	 detachment;	
as	one	out	of	state	alumna	said	“I	don’t	re-
ally	 feel	 a	 connection	 to	 the	 school	
anymore.”	Other	 self-descriptors	used	by	
out	of	state	alumni	included	being	an	“out-
sider”	 or	 being	 “on	 the	 edges”	 of	 the	
alumni	community.		

Finding 7 

SCP alumni seek engagement program-

ming that extends beyond the scope of 

social events, including calls to action for 

mentorship opportunities, sharing 

knowledge and expertise,  community ser-

vice activities, and affinity group 

gatherings. 

Correlated Key Research Question: What 

can SCP do to provide more meaningful 

and impactful forms of alumni engage-

ment?  

Despite	very	limited	school-sponsored	op-
portunities,	alumni	expressed	willingness,	
curiosity,	and	occasional	eagerness	to	en-
gage	 in	 meaningful	 shared	 community	
practices,	 whether	 through	 service	 pro-
jects,	 mentoring,	 professional	
collaboration,	 athletics,	 or	 the	 arts.	Men-
toring	 was	 the	 most	 favored	 outlet	 for	

shared	meaningful	 practice	 amongst	 SCP	
alumni.	The	desire	to	engage	in	these	sorts	
of	 activities	 was	 not	 tied	 to	 one’s	 geo-
graphic	 proximity	 to	 campus;	 alumni	
expressed	 a	 willingness	 to	 co-opt	 fellow	
alumni	in	their	region	to	galvanize	around	
meaningful	endeavors.	

Conclusion of Findings 
The	 alumni	 organization	 of	 SCP	 is	 rela-
tively	 large,	 somewhat	 engaged,	 and	
steeped	in	institutional	pride.	SCP	alumni	
identify	most	saliently	with	their	alma	ma-
ter	 through	 cherished	 relationships	 they	
began	while	there,	the	lived	experience	of	
multiple	layers	of	SCP	identity,	and	shared	
core	values	of	academic	excellence,	close-
knit	community,	and	hard	work.		The	per-
ceived	 prestige	 of	 SCP	 also	 nourishes	
alumni	 identification	 with	 the	 organiza-
tion;	 the	 desire	 to	 be	 affiliated	 with	 a	
winning	organization	is	powerful	(Ashford	
&	 Mael,	 1989).	 	 SCP	 alumni	 coalesce	
around	 school	 traditions,	 memories,	 and	
nostalgic	 lore,	 which	 contribute	 to	 their	
identification	 with	 their	 alma	 mater	 and	
the	 associated	 feelings	 of	 belongingness,	
pride,	 and	 affection.	 	 For	 some,	 the	 self-
concept	of	being	an	SCP	alumnus/a	ranks	
highly.	 These	 individuals	 typically	 live	
near	 campus	and	possess	more	 than	one	
SCP	identity.		“Lifers”	and	members	of	SCP	
legacy	 families	 are	 also	 likely	 to	 have	
higher	ranking	SCP	self-concepts.		Alumni	
who	live	further	from	campus	and	possess	
the	 singular	 identity	 of	 alumnus/a,	
demonstrate	a	lower	ranking	self-concept	
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as	an	SCP	alumnus/a,	and	are	more	likely	
to	feel	disconnected	from	the	institution	as	
a	result.			

SCP’s	 alumni	 relations	 team	 is	 driven	 by	
events	 and	 fundraising.	 	 Alumni	 social	
events	hosted	by	SCP	in	major	alumni-cen-
tric	 cities,	 along	 with	 local	 events	 like	
Alumni	 Reunion	Weekend	 provide	 large-
scale	 opportunities	 for	 the	 alumni	 to	
gather	 for	 camaraderie,	 food/drink,	 and	
conversation.		Other	than	participation	as	
a	donor,	events	are	the	primary	avenue	for	
alumni	to	engage	formally	with	their	alma	
mater.		A	robust	SCP	social	media	presence	
complements	 these	 structured	 in-person	
opportunities	 for	social	engagement	with	
alumni	 news,	 stories,	 and	 solicitations.	
The	 communication	 team’s	 recent	 efforts	
to	enrich	the	alumni	narrative	with	more	
personal	 stories	 highlighting	 a	 range	 of	
alumni	 has	 provided	 new	 pathways	 for	
SCP	alumni	to	explore	connectedness,	re-
new	interest,	and	tell	their	own	stories	as	
part	 of	 the	 SCP	 community.	 	 Outside	 of	
fundraising,	 social	 events	 and	 social	 me-
dia,	the	alumni	community	of	SCP	has	not	
been	 afforded	 consistent,	 ongoing	 pro-
grammatic	 opportunities	 to	 recognize	
their	collective	potential.		Despite	this	lack	
of	opportunity,	alumni	are	willing	to	more	
constructively	 engage	 with	 the	 SCP	 net-
work.	 A	 receptivity	 to	 participate	 in	
endeavors	 involving	 mentoring,	 commu-
nity	 service,	 and	 affinity	 group	
programming	in	sports	and	the	arts	is	evi-
dent	 amongst	 alumni.	 The	 interest	

amongst	 SCP	 alumni	 to	 have	 deeper	 and	
more	meaningful	channels	for	alumni	en-
gagement	is	present.		

Recommended Interven-
tions & Associated 
Evidence 
The	 goal	 of	 these	 recommendations	 is	 to	
enable	SCP	to	foster	more	meaningful	and	
impactful	 forms	 of	 alumni	 engagement,	
which	help	shape	a	sense	of	belonging	for	
the	members	 of	 the	 SCP	 alumni	 commu-
nity.	I	am	defining	alumni	engagement	as	a	
group	of	behaviors	in	which	alumni:	dedi-
cate	their	time	to	their	alma	mater,	donate	
their	talents	to	their	alma	mater,	make	a	fi-
nancial	 gift	 to	 their	 alma	 mater,	 and/or	
interact	with	fellow	alumni	in	ways	which	
enhance	the	alma	mater’s	networks	of	col-
laboration	 and/or	 community.	 On	 the	
basis	of	my	findings,	I	am	making	interven-
tion	 recommendations	 that	 are	 aligned	
with	 the	 previously	 discussed	 literature,	
are	 reflective	of	 the	distinct	SCP	commu-
nity,	 and	 also	 bear	 relevance	 for	 the	
independent	school	domain	at	 large,	as	 it	
collectively	wrestles	with	alumni	engage-
ment	 strategy.	 Recommendations	 are	
concentrated	 around	 the	 five	 themes	
which	 emerged	 through	 the	 coding	 and	
analysis	 processes:	 alumni	 engagement;	
core	values,	community	and	culture;	social	
identity	 and	 belongingness;	 meaningful	
shared	practices;	and	narratives/storytell-
ing.		
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Alumni Engagement  

• Limit	 large-scale	social	events	to	three	
or	 four	 major	 cities	 per	 year,	 where	
alumni	 are	 most	 concentrated,	 plus	
Homecoming	 &	 Reunion	 Weekend,	 in	
order	to	avail	human	resources	to	other	
engagement	 efforts.	 Continue	 having	
longtime	beloved	faculty	attend.		

• Ensure	all	gift	appeals	to	alumni	are	tar-
geted	 in	 nature.	 Consider	 a	
concentrated	 schedule	 for	 the	 annual	
fund	 alumni	 appeal	 during	 one	 6-8	
week	timeframe	per	year,	using	mixed	
media	platforms	such	as	videos,	text	to	
give,	traditional	mail,	and	social	media.	
Suggested	 focal	 themes	 for	alumni	an-
nual	 fund	 appeal	 include	 those	 most	
commonly	 emphasized	 by	 alumni	 in	
this	study:	pride/prestige	and	commu-
nity/people.	 If	 possible,	 integrate	 the	
concept	of	pride,	as	well	as	beloved	SCP	
faculty/coaches/mentors	 into	 alumni	
annual	fund	appeal.	

• Test-run	an	alumni	affinity	group	fund-
raising	appeal	to	a	targeted	alumni	sub-
community	such	as	a	longtime	success-
ful	 athletics	 program,	 the	
broadcasting/TV	 program,	 or	 an	 arts	
program	(such	as	the	dance	program).	
As	 part	 of	 the	 appeal,	 clearly	 identify	
the	 expectation	 for	 alumni	 to	 “give	
back”,	as	well	as	 the	specific	need	and	
purpose	of	the	funds	being	raised.		Part-
ner	 strategically	 with	 internal	

stakeholders	 of	 target	 group	 to	 effec-
tively	discern	needs,	goals,	and	desired	
outcomes	of	such	an	appeal.	

• Launch	educational	programming	with	
the	current	SCP	senior	class	to	steward,	
educate,	 and	 habituate	 future	 alumni	
giving.	Designate	a	senior	class	leader-
ship	 team	 of	 6-8	 students	 to	 partner	
with	advancement	staff	 to	support	 the	
execution	of	their	inaugural	class	gift.	In	
the	 fall,	 host	 a	 series	 of	 senior	 class	
breakfasts	before	school,	with	remarks	
from	 the	 Alumni	 Director	 and	 Annual	
Fund	Director	 about	 the	 power	 of	 be-
coming	a	part	of	the	SCP	alumni	family,	
and	a	pitch	for	class	gifts	in	the	form	of	
a	 “Dollar	 of	 Dedication”	 in	 honor	 of	 a	
coach/mentor/teacher	 who	 has	 influ-
enced	 them,	 with	 goal	 of	 100%	 class	
participation	 ($1-5	per	 student).	 Capi-
talize	 on	 successful	 completion	 of	
project	 through	 various	 school	 media	
platforms.		

• Use	exemplar	of	 recent	 successful	 stu-
dent-alumni	 journalism	 trip	 to	 New	
York	City	as	a	model	for	1-2	additional	
trips	in	popular	sectors	of	interest	such	
as	 finance,	 technology,	 and	marketing.	
Create	a	best	practice	model	 to	design	
future	 trips,	 and	 identify	 key	 alumni	
hosts	 and	 target	 cities.	 Celebrate	 the	
stories	of	these	alumni-student	profes-
sional	 partnership	 experiences	
throughout	various	 school	media	plat-
forms.		
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These	 recommendations	 align	 well	 with	
the	 previously	 discussed	 prior	 research	
about	alumni	engagement	and	 independ-
ent	schools.	We	know	that	contemporary	
alumni	 engagement	 practices	 cannot	 be	
primarily	driven	by	events;	 they	must	be	
agile,	multi-pronged,	and	complex	in	order	
to	bear	fruit	(Grace,	2019;	Weerts	&	Ronca,	
2009).	 	 Pre-existing	 research	 also	 shows	
that	 targeted	 appeals	 to	 affinity	 cohorts	
have	been	successful	(Baade	&	Sundberg,	
1996)	and	that	a	clear	expectation	of	giv-
ing	in	order	to	meet	essential	institutional	
needs	 results	 in	 gifts	 of	 time	 and	money	
(Tsao	 &	 Coll,	 2002;	 Weerts	 and	 Ronca,	
2009).	 Inclusion	 of	 beloved	 mentors	 or	
former	 teachers	 in	 engagement	 activities	
is	a	known	to	motivate	alumni	to	give	back	
time	and	money	to	their	alma	mater	(Clot-
felder,	 2003).	 The	 need	 to	 educate	 and	
steward	 the	next	 generation	of	 alumni	 is	
clearly	illuminated	by	trends	within	young	
alumni	 giving	 behavior	 and	 attitudes	
(McDearmon,	2010).	

Core Values, Community & Culture 

• In	 partnership	with	 the	 community	 at	
large,	 cultivate	 a	 newly	 created	 pres-
tige-oriented	affinity	group	such	as	an	
“SCP	40	Under	40”	which	identifies	and	
celebrates	younger	alumni	who	power-
fully	reflect	the	school’s	mission	in	their	
current	 profession/craft,	 volunteer	
work	 and/or	 personal	 pursuits.	 Pro-
mote	 an	 online	 community-wide	
nominations	 process	 and	 strategically	
engage	 an	 alumni	 advisory	 panel	 to	

make	the	selections.	Host	an	on-campus	
reception	for	honorees	(perhaps	in	co-
ordination	 with	 Alumni	 Reunion	
Weekend),	 and	 strategically	 an-
nounce/celebrate	 the	 honorees	 and	
their	accomplishments	 through	media.	
The	processes	of	 learning	about	nomi-
nees	 will	 provide	 rich	 data	 for	 the	
alumni	 relations	 and	 communications	
teams’	continued	work.		

• Increase	utilization	of	hashtags	with	the	
words	“pride”	and/or	“proud”	on	digital	
collateral	and	 in	 social	media	 targeted	
towards	 alumni.	 Develop	 additional	
alumni	 merchandise	 integrating	 the	
words	pride	and	proud.	

• Build	a	centralized	digital	alumni	com-
munity	 by	 adopting	 an	 alumni	
networking	 platform	 partner,	 such	 as	
Graduway,	 to	 custom	 design	 one	 pri-
mary	 digital	 alumni	 networking	 tool	
that	 can	 serve	 as	 a	 domain	 for	 SCP	
alumni	to	independently	network,	seek	
out	 fellow	 alumni	 in	 their	 geographic	
region	or	industry,	share	news/stories,	
job/internship	hunt,	and	facilitate	men-
toring	 partnerships.	 With	 support	 of	
Graduway	(or	preferred	partner),	stra-
tegically	 launch	 platform	 to	 optimize	
alumni	onboarding/utilization.		

These	recommendations	are	supported	by	
the	 literature,	which	 illustrates	 that	 feel-
ings	 of	 pride	 and	perceptions	 of	 prestige	
increase	one’s	social	 identification	with	a	
group.	Positive	social	 identification	nour-
ishes	 self-esteem,	 and	 motivates	 one’s	
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desire	to	be	affiliated	with	a	successful	or-
ganization	(Ashford	&	Mael,	1989).	Tactics	
like	strategically	leveraging	the	illustrious	
success	stories	of	alumni,	and	emphasizing	
the	collective	 feelings	of	pride	within	 the	
alumni	 community	 have	 been	 shown	 to	
have	a	high	level	of	effectiveness	 in	prior	
studies,	contributing	to	individuals’	desire	
to	 claim	membership	within	 groups	 they	
and	others	perceive	as	favorable	(Hogg,	et.	
al.,	 1995).	 The	 recommended	digital	 net-
working	alumni	community	is	illustrative	
of	 a	 communities	 of	 practice	 model;	 re-
search	supports	that	this	inventive	type	of	
organizational	design	as	flexible,	dynamic,	
and	 conducive	 to	 fostering	 learning	
through	mentorship	(Lave,	1996).	Alumni	
participants	 in	 this	 digital	 version	 of	 the	
SCP	community	would	have	the	ability	to	
permeate	 in	 and	 out	 of	 various	 stages	 of	
development,	depending	upon	their	needs,	
skills,	 and	 the	 available	 interactions	 and	
activities	(Wenger,	1998).		

Social Identity/Belongingness 

• Engender	 feelings	 of	 social	 identifica-
tion	 and	 belongingness	 with	 SCP	
alumni	by	offering	a	more	diverse	menu	
of	programming	that	includes	strategic	
engagement	 of	 mixed	 age	 affinity	
groups.	 For	 example,	 invite	 all	 theater	
arts	alumni	or	football	alumni	to	return	
to	campus	for	an	alumni	dinner/recep-
tion,	 followed	 by	 a	 performance	 of	 an	
SCP	 upper	 school	 musical	 or	 playoff	
game.	Invite	current	and	former	faculty,	
coaches,		and	alumni	parent	volunteers	

who	engaged	in	these	affinity	groups	to	
these	events	as	well.	Additionally,	host	
bi-annual	luncheons	on	campus	for	re-
tired	faculty	and	staff,	reminding	them	
that	 they	 are	 still	 valued	 members	 of	
the	 SCP	 family.	 Share	 photo	 collateral	
from	these	affinity	gatherings	with	the	
SCP	community,	and	invite	their	former	
colleagues	and	current	students	of	 the	
recently	retired	to	stop	by	these	gather-
ings.	

• Capitalize	on	the	innately	powerful	SCP	
affinity	 groups	 of	 “lifers”	 (alumni	who	
attended	 SCP	 for	 13	 years),	 	 local	
alumni,	and	legacy	families	with	strate-
gic	 programming	 and	 outreach.	
Dedication	 to	 an	 annual	 legacy	 family	
event,	 with	 a	 legacy	 keynote	 speaker	
and	multiple	 generations	 of	 SCP	 fami-
lies	 in	 attendance	 is	 recommended	 to	
further	stoke	the	pride	and	social	iden-
tification	 this	 group	 has	 with	 SCP.	
“Legacy	Limelight”	and/	or	“Lifer	Lime-
light”	featurette	stories	on	these	affinity	
groups	 are	 also	 a	 recommended	 addi-
tion	 to	 the	 communications	 stream.	
Consider	design	of	an	SCP	Lifer	Society	
for	 individuals	 who	 belong	 to	 that	
group,	 cultivating	 a	 powerful	 pipeline	
of	proud	alumni	association	volunteers,	
donors,	and	leaders.		

These	recommendations	are	firmly	rooted	
in	 research	 about	 the	 power	 of	 affinity	
groups	as	positive	catalysts	for	feelings	of	
belongingness	 within	 organizations;	 the	
desire	 to	 gather	 around	 shared	 symbols	
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and	 traditions	 within	 a	 specific	 social	
group	 is	 a	 powerful	motivator	 to	 engage	
with	 the	organization	at	 large	 (Clotfelter,	
2003;	 Baade	 &	 Sundberg,	 1996).	 Legacy	
families	 are	 proven	 to	 be	 demonstrably	
more	 generous	 with	 their	 alma	 maters,	
primarily	 due	 to	 their	 identity	 salience	
with	 the	 institution	 (Clotfelter,	 2003).	 In	
prior	 research,	 individuals	 with	 multiple	
layers	of	institutional	identity	are	seen	as	
“intertwined	 with	 the	 fate	 of	 the	 group”	
(Foote,	 1951)	 and	 therefore	 more	 moti-
vated	towards	engagement.	

Meaningful Shared Practices 
Respond	 to	 the	 expressed	 desire	 for	
alumni	to	engage	in	mentoring	by	partner-
ing	 more	 strategically	 with	 the	 SCP	
Institute	for	Civic	Involvement.		

• Together	with	 the	 Institute,	 design	 an	
alumni	speaker	series	for	the	upcoming	
school	 year	which	 targets	 alumni	who	
fit	 the	 curricular	 and	 programmatic	
needs	 of	 the	 Institute.	 Invite	 4-6	 key	
alumni	to	engage	in	the	project	in	year	
1,	and	plan	on-campus	experiences	for	
them	 which	 integrate	 time	 with	 stu-
dents	in	large	and	small	formats	(i.e.:	an	
assembly	format	and	as	a	guest	lecturer	
in	a	relevant	class)	as	well	as	the	oppor-
tunity	 for	 them	 to	 liaise	 with	 former	
faculty.	 Celebrate	 new	 program	 part-
nership	in	all	media	formats.		

• Also	partner	with	the	Civic	Institute	in	
their	 mission	 to	 “recognize	 the	 im-
portance	of	specialized	formal	training,	

interspersed	 with	 internship,	 for	 the	
profession	 of	 public	 service”	 to	 crea-
tively	 design	 additional	 mentoring	
interfaces	 between	 alumni	 and	 stu-
dents	 (www.scp.edu).	 Ideally,	 this	
would	be	a	collaboration	with	responsi-
bility	shared	between	the	alumni	office	
personnel	and	civic	institute	personnel,	
that	adds	value	 to	 the	prospect	of	SCP	
students	 seeking	 summer	 internships	
in	 a	 field	 of	 interest	 after	 their	 junior	
and	senior	years,	and/or	young	alumni	
sourcing	internships	within	the	alumni	
network	 during	 their	 college	 years.	 A	
year-one	pilot	goal	of	8-10	alumni-stu-
dent	 or	 young	 alumni-older	 alumni	
internship	 matches	 is	 suggested,	 with	
close	oversight/intentional	mentor	 re-
cruitment	by	SCP	personnel.		

• Experiment	with	 a	 small-scale	 activity	
led	by	regional	alumni	for	participation	
in	 a	 service	 project	 in	 collaboration	
with	 a	 local	 community-based	 organi-
zation.	 Examples	 include	 a	 group	 of	
alumni	 cooking	 dinner	 together	 at	 a	
homeless	shelter,	making	care	packages	
for	troops	stationed	abroad	(perhaps	in	
connection	with	 an	 alumnus/a	who	 is	
currently	 serving),	 or	 gathering	 to-
gether	 for	 a	 local	 beach	 cleanup.	 A	
project	 could	 launch	within	 the	 legacy	
family	 community,	 welcoming	 adults	
and	 children,	 and	 perhaps	 co-opting	 a	
legacy	parent	to	help	lead	the	initiative.	
Share	 news	 about	 the	 project	 on	 vari-
ous	media	platforms	to	discern	broader	
interest.	If	feedback	is	positive,	explore	
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longer-term	style	engagements	such	as	
a	Habitat	for	Humanity	partnership.		

• Reach	 out	 to	 a	 hand-picked	 group	 of	
stakeholders	 including	 older	 regional	
alumni,	 retired	 regional	 faculty,	 and	
alumni	parents	to	discern	potential	in-
terest	 in	 galvanizing	 around	
volunteering	 to	 organize/oversee	 the	
school’s	 archives	 program.	Work	with	
internal	 stakeholders	 in	 possession	 of	
the	current	school	archival	materials	to	
assess	the	possibility	for	this	as	a	long-
term	platform	for	affinity	engagement,	
as	the	school	navigates	more	closely	to-
wards	its	centennial.		

In	 order	 to	 best	 facilitate	 activities	 of	
meaningful	 shared	 practice	 within	 the	
alumni	 community,	 SCP	 must	 be	 inten-
tional	in	embracing	the	proven	attributes	
of	independent	schools	as	close-knit	com-
munities	 which	 nurture	 students	 into	
becoming	 responsible,	 successful	 citizens	
of	 the	 world	 (NAIS.org).	 It’s	 imperative	
that	schools	like	SCP	fashion	their	own	mi-
cro-cosmic	 intellectual	 and	 creative	
marketplaces	where	alumni	and	students,	
and	 young	 alumni	 and	 older	 alumni	 can	
more	meaningfully	interact.	I’m	proposing	
interventions	 in	 this	 section	 that	 do	 not	
find	a	home	in	the	literature,	because	they	
are	mostly	unexplored	within	 the	 realms	
of	 independent	 schools	 and	 alumni	 en-
gagement.	While	 the	 independent	 school	
domain	 is	 under-researched,	 we	 know	
that	it	is	it	characterized	by	strong	commu-
nity,	ideals	of	responsibility,	collaboration	

and	 excellence,	 and	 providing	 students	
with	 individualized	 attention	 (AIMS-
MDDC.org,	 CAISCA.org,	 AINSNE.org,	
SAIS.org).	 A	 synthesis	 of	 these	 attributes	
with	the	communities	of	practice	body	of	
literature’s	assertion	that	voluntary	actors	
provide	intellectual	and	social	leadership,	
serving	to	energize	and	mentor	fellow	par-
ticipants	 around	 ideas	 and	 work	 that	
matter	 to	 people	 (Wenger,	 1998;	 Lave,	
1996)	offers	a	highly	optimistic	portrait	of	
possibilities	 for	 the	 above	 recommenda-
tions.		

Narratives/Storytelling 

• Create	an	alumni	podcast	to	enrich	the	
alumni	narrative.	Work	in	collaboration	
with	the	SCP	production	studio	and	the	
communications	to	team	to	record	and	
edit	 the	 podcast	 for	monthly	 distribu-
tion.	Create	a	diverse	list	of	prospective	
alumni	guests,	and	secure	individuals	to	
be	interviewed	on	the	podcast	in	a	short	
format	(15-20	minutes)	with	set	ques-
tions	that	invite	alumni	to	share	stories	
about	their	days	at	SCP,	their	path	since	
graduation,	and	nostalgic	memories	of	
former	 teachers	 and	 campus	 culture.		
When	possible,	 align	 guests	with	 rele-
vant	events	such	as	milestone	reunions,	
sports	seasons,	and/or	an	opportunity	
for	them	to	promote	a	meaningful	per-
sonal	 accomplishment	 or	 activity.		
Pursue	a	similar	activity/collaboration	
with	the	students	of	the	on-campus	TV	
station,	where	alumni	are	invited	on	to	
“guest	host”	or	be	interviewed.	
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• Reframe	 the	 narrative	 on	 the	 alumni	
portion	of	the	SCP	website	to	shift	from	
focusing	 heavily	 on	 events,	 to	 more	
prominently	and	creatively	sharing	sto-
ries	 of	 alumni.	 Build	 the	 alumni	
messaging	around	concepts	of	SCP	com-
munity,	nostalgia,	pride,	and	stories	of	
alumni	 by	 placing	 the	 social	 media	
feeds	 as	 side	 banners	 on	 the	 alumni	
webpage,	 and	 including	 links	 to	 all	
alumni-related	social	media	platforms.	
As	 new	 programming	 for	 affinity	
groups,	 alumni	mentoring,	 community	
service,	 40	Under	40,	 the	podcast,	 etc.	
takes	 shape,	 prominently	 share	 these	
assets	 on	 the	 alumni	website	 in	 a	 dy-
namic	way.		

• As	part	and	parcel	of	the	integration	of	
these	new	alumni	program	and	engage-
ment	 opportunities	 on	 the	 alumni	
website	 and	 in	 other	 forms	 of	 media,	
have	explicit	calls	to	action	for	alumni--
exclusive	of	a	click	to	donate	money.	Ex-
amples	 might	 be	 “Click	 here	 to	
Nominate	 a	 40	 Under	 40	 alumnus/a,”	
“Sign	 up	 here	 for	 Service	 Opportuni-
ties,”	 and	 “Register	 Today	 to	 Join	 our	
Alumni	Networking	Platform.”		

• Launch	 an	 SCP	 alumni-centric	 Insta-
gram	handle.	While	the	current	school-
wide	 SCP	 Instagram	 has	 occasional	
alumni	 postings,	 there	 should	 be	
enough	 alumni-centric	 news,	 folklore,	
and	 overall	 content	 to	 attract	 alumni	
ages	18-35.	Both	the	school	and	alumni	

handles	 could	 share	 content	when	ap-
propriate.	The	alumni	Facebook	handle	
could	 also	 share	 postings	 with	 the	
alumni	Instagram	handle.		

These	 interventions	 are	 undergirded	 by	
numerous	 studies	 which	 purport	 that	
more	volume	and	more	varied	communi-
cations	 are	 best	 when	 it	 comes	 to	
motivating	 alumni	 engagement	 (McDear-
mon,	2010);	younger	alumni	in	particular	
are	proven	to	be	highly	receptive	to	a	vari-
ety	 of	 communications,	 and	 repelled	 by	
only	 receiving	 impersonal	 intermittent	
snail	mail	solicitations	(Tsao	&	Coll,	2005).	
The	 prior	 research	 also	 illustrates	 that	
easy	 access	 to	 digital	 alumni	 networking	
platforms	 is	 valued	 by	 alumni	 (McDear-
mon,	2010)	and	that	repeated	and	varied	
calls	to	action	result	in	an	overall	increase	
in	volunteer	and	donor	behaviors	(Weerts	
&	Ronca,	2009).	 In	addition,	a	reframe	of	
the	SCP	alumni	narrative	away	from	high-
lighting	 large-scale	 social	 events	 and	
instead	 toward	 focusing	on	 stories	 about	
alumni	 which	 celebrate	 the	 distinctive	
value	proposition	of	being	a	part	of	the	SCP	
community	 amplify	 the	 likelihood	 of	
alumni	 positively	 identifying	 with	 SCP	
(Oakes	&	Turner,	1986).	Alumni	who	are	
persuaded	to	see	their	alma	mater	as	valu-
able	 and	 unique	 in	 comparison	 to	 other	
schools	 are	 more	 likely	 to	 identify	 with	
their	alma	mater,	and	 in	 turn,	potentially	
engage	in	behaviors	that	will	nourish	their	
ties	 to	 the	organization	(Oakes	&	Turner,	
1986).	
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Planning for Interactions 
of Interventions on  
Organization 
In	order	to	position	itself	for	success	in	un-
dertaking	 the	 recommended	
interventions/changes	 in	 practice,	 SCP	 is	
encouraged	 to	 harness	 the	 following	 re-
sources	and	competencies:	

• Coalesce	 a	 team	 of	 key	 internal	 em-
ployee	 stakeholders	 to	 overlay	
recommended	 interventions	 with	 the	
2019-2024	SCP	Strategic	Plan.	 Investi-
gate	 overlapping	 motifs	 more	 deeply,	
particularly	 those	 aligned	 with	 the	
themes	 which	 emerged	 through	 the	
coding	 and	 analysis	 processes	 of	 this	
project:	 alumni	 engagement,	 core	 val-
ues,	 community	 and	 culture,	 social	
identity/	 belongingness,	 meaningful	
shared	practices,	and	narratives/story-
telling.	 Prioritize	 activation	 of	
interventions	 in	 accordance	with	 find-
ings	of	this	exercise.		

• Ensure	there	is	active	and	ongoing	col-
laboration	 and	 communication	
between	the	alumni	relations	personnel	
and	 the	 communications	 personnel	 to	
foster	 departmental	 synergy,	 goals	
alignment,	 and	 mapping	 of	 timelines,	
responsibilities,	and	messaging.	Due	to	
physical	separation	of	departments/of-
fices,	 integrate	 an	 intra-office	 project	
management	software	platform	such	as	

Basecamp	 to	 communicate,	 create	 cal-
endars/schedules,	 and	 share	
documents	and	files.		

• Much	of	 the	work	 in	 these	recommen-
dations	is	not	aligned	with	the	ebb	and	
flow	 of	 a	 transactional,	 traditional	 gift	
officer	role.	It	is	recommended	that	the	
SCP	 Vice	 President	 of	 Advancement	
consider	onboarding	an	SCP	alumnus/a	
employee	who	 is	not	a	gift	officer,	but	
rather	a	“friendraiser”	whose	goals	and	
responsibilities	include:		

• Working	in	close	collaboration	with	the	
communications	 team	 on	 sourcing,	
writing,	and	designing	key	creative	col-
lateral	for	the	alumni	program	

• In	 concert	 with	 the	 communications	
team,	crafting	social	media	 flow	for	all	
alumni	 relations	 digital	 platforms	
(LinkedIn,	Graduway,	 Instagram,	Face-
book)	

• Being	a	frontline	creative	and	program-
matic	 partner	 with	 key	 internal	
stakeholders	 (Director	 of	 Civic	 Insti-
tute,	 Director	 of	 College	 Counseling,	
Upper/Middle/Lower	School	Heads)	to	
unearth	and	optimize	potential	alumni-
student	learning	opportunities	and	col-
laborations	

• Managing	and	executing	programmatic	
initiatives	 such	 as	 the	 senior	 class	
breakfasts,	the	podcast,	40	Under	40,	af-
finity	 group	 gatherings,	 and	 alumni	
community	service		
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• Ensure	there	is	active	and	ongoing	col-
laboration	 and	 communication	
between	the	gift	officers	and	alumni	re-
lations	personnel.	Specifically,	fostering	
close	 strategic	 partnerships	 between	
the	 Alumni	 Director,	 Director	 of	 Ad-
vancement,	 and	 Director	 of	 the	 SCP	
Fund	(and	the	suggested	new	hire,	if	ap-
plicable)	 is	 essential	 to	 successfully	
realizing	 the	 possibilities	 of	 the	 inter-
ventions.	 This	 includes	 teamwork	
around	game	plans	 for	alumni	appeals	
and	clear	mutual	understandings	about	
goals	 and	 desired	 outcomes	 of	 alumni	
programming.		

Conclusion 
As	previously	stated,	the	alumni	organiza-
tion	 of	 SCP	 is	 relatively	 large,	 somewhat	
engaged,	 and	 steeped	 in	 institutional	
pride.	 SCP	 alumni	 identify	most	 saliently	
with	 their	 alma	mater	 through	 cherished	
relationships	 they	began	while	 there,	 the	
lived	experience	of	multiple	layers	of	SCP	
identity,	 and	 shared	 core	 values	 of	 aca-
demic	 excellence,	 close-knit	 community,	
and	hard	work.	 	Despite	 the	 fact	 that	 the	
potential	of	the	SCP	alumni	community	has	
not	yet	been	actualized,	many	of	the	ingre-
dients	for	 its	success	are	present.	Alumni	
are	deeply	proud	of	their	alma	mater;	mul-
tiple	alumni	affinity	groups	fundamentally	
enhance	 the	 community	 at	 large;	 alumni	
clearly	manifest	their	motivation	to	diver-
sify	 their	 engagement	 beyond	 traditional	
events	 and	 fundraising.	 By	 putting	 forth	

the	effort	necessary	to	foster	more	mean-
ingful	and	impactful	forms	of	engagement	
for	 its	 alumni,	 SCP	 will	 derive	 expected	
and	unforeseen	benefits	for	years	to	come.		

	



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 41	

References 
About	NAIS.	(n.d.).	Retrieved	from	https://www.nais.org/about/about-nais/	

About	SAIS.	(n.d.).	Retrieved	from	https://www.sais.org/default.aspx	

AIMS	Mission.	(n.d.).	Retrieved	from	https://www.aimsmddc.org/default.aspx	

AISNE	-	Association	of	Independent	Schools	in	New	England	Mission.	(n.d.).	Retrieved	from	

https://www.aisne.org/	

Baade,	R.,	&	Sundberg,	J.	(1996).	Fourth	Down	and	Gold	to	Go?	Assessing	the	Link	between		

Athletics	and	Alumni	Giving.	O.	Social	Science	Quarterly,	77(4),	789-803.	doi:		

http://www.jstor.org/stable/42863532		 	

Baade,	Robert	A.,	and	Jeffrey	O.	Sundberg.	(1996).	What	Determines	Alumni	Generosity?		

Economics	of	Education	Review,	15(1),	75-81.	doi:	10.1016/0272-	7757(95)00026-7		

California	Association	of	Independent	Schools	Mission.	(n.d.).		Retrieved	from	

https://www.caisca.org/	

Council	for	Advancement	and	Support	of	Education.	(2018).	Alumni	Engagement	Metrics	

[White	paper].	Retrieved	from	https://www.case.org/system/files/me-

dia/file/CASEWhitePaper_AlumniMetrics.pdf	

Clotfelter,	C.T.	(2003).	Alumni	giving	to	elite	private	colleges	and	universities.	Economics	of		

Education	Review	22:109–120.doi:		



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 42	

http://theunbrokenwindow.com/Higher%20Ed/Readings/Clotfelter%20-

%20EER%20Alumni.pdf		

Foote,	N.	(1951).	Identification	as	the	Basis	for	a	Theory	of	Motivation.	American	Sociologi-

cal	Review,	16(1),	14-21.	Retrieved	from	

http://www.jstor.org.proxy.library.vanderbilt.edu/stable/2087964	

Gallup	and	the	National	Association	of	Independent	Schools.	(2017).	NAIS-Gallup	Report	on	

NAIS	Graduates	Seeking	Critical	Collegiate	Experiences	and	Consistent	Progression	in	

Higher	Education.	Retrieved	from	https://www.nais.org/media/MemberDocu-

ments/Research/NAIS-Gallup-Report-on-NAIS-Graduates.pdf	

Grace,	C.	O.	N.	(2019).	Alumni	Relations	Engagement	Strategies.	Independent	School	Maga-

zine.	Retrieved	from	https://www.nais.org/magazine/independent-school/winter-

2019/alumni-relations-engagement-strategies/	

Hamilton-Kirk,	L.	(2018,	September	4).	Uncovering	New	Strategies	to	Grow	Enroll-

ment.	Https://Www.nais.org.	Retrieved	from	

https://www.nais.org/learn/independent-ideas/september-2018/uncovering-new-

strategies-to-grow-enrollment/	

Hoerle,	H.	(2017,	February).	Association	of	Delaware	Valley	Independent	Schools	Confer-

ence.	Association	of	Delaware	Valley	Independent	Schools	Conference.	Retrieved	from	

https://www.advis.org/Customized/Uploads/ByDate/2017/January_2017/Janu-

ary_19th_2017/2017-01-19	State	of	Enrollment	-	Hoerle95329.pdf	

Hoerle,	H.	(2017).	Rethinking	the	Role	of	Enrollment	Managers	and	Admission	Offic-

ers.	Https://Www.nais.org.	Retrieved	from	



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 43	

https://www.nais.org/magazine/independent-school/summer-2017/trend-watch-

ers/	

Hogg,	M.	A.,	Terry,	D.	J.,	&	White,	K.	M.	(1995).	A	Tale	of	Two	Theories:	A	Critical	Compari-

son	of	Identity	Theory	with	Social	Identity	Theory.	Social	Psychology	

Quarterly,	58(4),	255–269.	Retrieved	from	https://www.jstor.org/stable/2787127	

Accessed:	31-08-2019	20:07	UTC	

Hogg,	M.	A.,	&	Turner,	J.	C.	(1985).	Interpersonal	attraction,	social	identification	and	psy-

chological	group	formation.	European	Journal	of	Social	Psychology,	15(1),	51–66.	doi:	

https://doi-org.proxy.library.vanderbilt.edu/10.1002/ejsp.2420150105	

Lave,	J.	(1991).	Chapter	4:	Situating	learning	in	communities	of	practice.	In	Perspectives	on	

socially	shared	cognition.	doi:	http://dx.doi.org/10.1037/10096-003	

Lave,	J.	(1996).	Teaching,	as	Learning	in	Practice.	Mind,	Culture,	and	Activity,	3(3),	149–164.	

doi:	DOI:	10.1207/s15327884mca0303_2	

McDearmon,	J.	T.	(2010).	What's	in	it	for	me:	A	qualitative	look	into	the	mindset	of	young		

alumni	non-donors.	International	Journal	of	Educational	Advancement,	10(1),	33-47.	

doi:	http://dx.doi.org.proxy.library.vanderbilt.edu/10.1057/ijea.2010.3		

McDearmon,	J.	T.	(2013).	Hail	to	thee,	our	alma	mater:	Alumni	role	identity	and	the	rela-

tionship	to	institutional	support	behaviors.	Research	in	Higher	Education,	54(3),	

283-302.	doi:		

http://dx.doi.org.proxy.library.vanderbilt.edu/10.1007/s11162-012-	9271-6		

McDearmon,	J.	T.,	&	Shirley,	K.	(2009).	Characteristics	and	institutional	factors	related	to		



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 44	

young	alumni	donors	and	non-donors.	International	Journal	of	Educational	Advance-

ment,9(2),	83–95.	doi:	https://doi.org/10.1057/ijea.2009.29		

Monks,	J.	(2003).	Patterns	of	giving	to	one's	alma	mater	among	young	graduates	from	selec-

tive		

institutions.	Economics	of	Education	Review,	22,	121–130.		

doi:http://theunbrokenwindow.com/Higher%20Ed/Readings/Monks%20EER%2		

0Young%20Gifts.pdf		

NAIS	Data	and	Analysis	for	School	Leadership.	(n.d.).	NAIS	Data	and	Analysis	for	School	

Leadership.	National	Association	of	Independent	Schools.	Retrieved	from	

https://www.nais.org/media/Nais/Statistics/Documents/FactsA-

taGlanceAllNAISMembers2019.pdf	

Oakes,	P.,	&	Turner,	J.	C.	(1986).	Distinctiveness	and	the	salience	of	social	category	mem-

berships:	Is	there	an	automatic	perceptual	bias	towards	novelty?	.	European	Journal	

of	Social	Psychology,	16,	325–344.	doi:	http://dx.doi.org/10.1002/ejsp.2420160403	

SCP	Institute	for	Civic	Involvement	(n.d.).	Retrieved	from	https://scp.edu	

Tajfel,	H.,	&	Turner,	J.	C.	(1979).	An	Integrative	Theory	of	Intergroup	Conflict.	In	S.	Worchel	

&	W.	G.	Austin	(Eds.),	The	Social	Psychology	of	Intergroup	Relations	.	Retrieved	from	

https://books.google.com/books?id=l2R7DwAAQBAJ&lpg=PA56&ots=Az3z2ReXFO

&dq=Tajfel,	H.,	&	Turner,	J.	C.	(1979).	An	Integrative	Theory	of	Intergroup	Conflict.	

In	W.	G.	Austin,	&	S.	Worchel	(Eds.),	The	Social	Psychology	of	Intergroup	Relations	

(pp.	33-47).	Monterey,	CA:	Brooks/Cole&lr&pg=PA47#v=onepage&q&f=false	



	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	 45	

Tajfel,	H.,	&	Turner,	J.	C.	(1985).	The	social	identity	theory	of	intergroup	behavior.	In	S.	

Worchel	&	W.	G.	Austin	(Eds.),	Psychology	of	intergroup	relations(2nd	ed.,	pp.	7–24).	

Chicago,	IL:	Nelson-Hall.	

Thelin,	J.,	&	Trollinger,	R.	(2014).	Philanthropy	and	American	Higher	Education(1st	ed.).	

New	York,	NY:	Palgrave	MacMillan.	

Weerts,	D.	J.,	&	Ronca,	J.	M.	(2007).	Profiles	of	supportive	alumni:	Donors,	volunteers,	and	

those	who	“do	it	all”.	International	Journal	of	Educational	Advancement,	7(1),	20–34.	

doi:	https://doi.org/10.1057/palgrave.ijea.2150044	com.proxy.library.vander-

bilt.edu/lib/Vand/detail.action?docID=1913533		

Weerts,	D.	J.,	&	Ronca,	J.	M.	(2009).	Using	classification	trees	to	predict	alumni	giving	for		

higher	education.	Education	Economics,	17(1),95-122.	dio:	

10.1080/09645290801976985		

Wenger,	E.	(1998).	Communities	of	practice:	Learning	as	a	social	system.	.	Retrieved	from	

https://thesystemsthinker.com/communities-of-practice-learning-as-a-social-sys-

tem/	

Wenger,	E.,	&	Snyder,	W.	(2000).	Communities	of	Practice:	The	organizational	fron-

tier.		Harvard	Business	Review,	(R00110),	139–145.	Retrieved	from	

https://hbr.org/2000/01/communities-of-practice-the-organizational-frontier	

	 	



	
	
	
	

Appendix	A	
SCP	Internal		

	
	

	 46	

 



	
	
	
	

Appendix	B	
SCP	Giving	Data	

	
	

	 47	

 

 
 



	
	
	
	

Appendix	C	
School	Profile	

	
	

	 48	

 



	
	
	
	

Appendix	C	
School	Profile	

	
	

	 49	

 



	
	
	
	

Appendix	D	
Interview	Protocol:	School	Administrator	

	
	

	 50	

Carrie	M.	Grimes,	M.A.	
Doctoral	Candidate	at	Vanderbilt	University	
Empathy	Interview	Template	for	Capstone	Research:	School	Administrator	Interview	

	
Alumni	Engagement	Research:	School	Administrator	Interview	Framework	

	
Primary	Goal:		To	gain	a	deeper	understanding	of	school	administrators’	beliefs,	percep-
tions,	activities	and	goals	regarding	SCP’s	alumni	programming,	applying	lenses	of	social	
identity/community	of	practice	theories.	
	
Goals	for	Alumni	Empathy	Interviews:	&	Focus	Groups	

● Seek	to	understand,	not	confirm	
● Ask	once,	clearly—avoid	yes/no	questions	
● Ask	questions	that	elicit	stories	and	feelings	
● Welcome	dialogue	within	the	group	
● Remember	to	probe:	“Tell	me	more…”		“What	was	that	like	for	you?”	“Why?”	

	
Questions:	
	

● How	would	you	describe	overall	alumni	engagement	at	SCP?	
● What	do	you	believe	are	the	common	core	values	and	guiding	principles	of	SCP?	
● Which	of	these	values	do	you	believe	also	are	reflected	the	alumni	body?	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	that	SCP	‘s	efforts	to	engage	alumni	were	a	success.	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	that	SCP	‘s	efforts	to	engage	alumni	failed.	
● How	did	you	feel	that	those	moment	reflected	upon	SCP	at	large?	
● Tell	me	about	ways	in	which	your	team	promotes	a	sense	of	belonging	within	the	

SCP	alumni	community.		
● Tell	me	about	your	primary	mechanisms	for	sharing	the	SCP	alumni	narrative	

within	the	alumni	body	as	well	as	the	community	at	large.		
● Tell	me	what	makes	the	community	of	alumni	here	distinct.		
● Tell	me	a	story	about	when	you	witnessed	alumni	connecting	in	a	special	way	to	

each	other,	and/or	to	the	SCP	community.	
○ Why	do	you	think	they	felt	a	sense	of	connection?	

■ What	did	they	do	in	that	moment?	
■ How	did	your	team	celebrate/leverage/recognize	that	moment	of	

connectivity?	
	

● Share	a	story	about	a	time	when	SCP	has	organized/executed	meaningful	shared	ac-
tivities	(excluding	purely	social	events)	for	SCP	alumni.	

● How	was	information/knowledge	shared	in	this	moment?	
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● Tell	me	ways	in	which	cohorts	of	the	alumni	community	coalesce/galvanize	to	en-

gage	in	activities	outside	of	socializing.	What	do	these	activities	look	like?		
	

● Tell	me	about	a	time	when	you	have	witnessed	the	SCP	alumni	community	come	to-
gether	in	order	to	solve	a	problem,	accomplish	a	goal,	or	share	valuable	knowledge?		

○ How	did	that	feel	for	the	community?	
○ How	did	this	kind	of	engagement	compare	to	purely	social	en-

gagement?	
○ What	residue	were	you	able	to	pull	from	these	collective	mo-

ments	to	build	your	brand?		
	

● What	percentage	of	the	alumni	community	would	you	say	exists	at	the	core/heart	
and	what	percentage	at	its	edges/boundaries?		

● What	do	you	think	differentiates	these	groups?	
● How	does	nostalgia	play	a	role	in	the	SCP	alumni	narrative?	
● How	does	mentoring	play	a	role	in	the	SCP	alumni	narrative?	

	
● What	percentage	of	alumni	give	to	the	annual	fund?		

○ What	types	of	things	do	you	belivee	motivate	alumni	to	make	a	gift	to	SCP?	
○ What	are	your	primary	strategies	with	alumni	in	your	annual	fund	campaign?	

	
● What	do	you	believe	would	inspire	alumni	the	most	to	give	to	a	financial	gift	of	any	

size	to	SCP?		
	

● How	would	you	describe	the	alumni	community’s	relationship	with	SCP’s	current	
school	community	of	faculty/staff,	parents,	trustees,	and	administrators?		

	
● Who	at	SCP	notices	alumni	engagement?	

• 	

● What	do	they	think	the	SCP	alumni	bring	to	the	community?	

• 	

● What	is	the	alumni	community’s	involvement	in	setting	direction	for	the	commu-
nity?	
	

	
	
	
Conduct	Interviews	(30	minutes):	
My	notes:	
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Post-Interview	Reflections	
What	did	I	hear?	What	am	I	learning	about	the	root	causes	that	contribute	to	the	problem?		
Are	there	questions	I	wish	I	would	have	asked	or	not	asked?	Are	there	questions	that	
were	particularly	fruitful?	Did	I	probe	effectively?	
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Carrie	M.	Grimes,	M.A.	
Doctoral	Candidate	at	Vanderbilt	University	
Empathy	Interview	Template	for	Capstone	Research:	Alumnus/a	Interview	

	
Alumni	Engagement	Research:	Alumnus/a	Interview	Framework	

	
Primary	Goal:		To	gain	a	deeper	understanding	of	alumnus/a’s		beliefs,	perceptions,	activi-
ties	and	goals	regarding	SCP’s	alumni	programming,	applying	lenses	of	social	
identity/community	of	practice	theories.	
	
Goals	for	Alumni	Empathy	Interviews:	&	Focus	Groups	

● Seek	to	understand,	not	confirm	
● Ask	once,	clearly—avoid	yes/no	questions	
● Ask	questions	that	elicit	stories	and	feelings	
● Welcome	dialogue	within	the	group	
● Remember	to	probe:	“Tell	me	more…”		“What	was	that	like	for	you?”	“Why?”	

	
Questions:	
	

● How	would	you	describe	overall	alumni	engagement	at	SCP?	
● What	do	you	believe	are	the	common	core	values	and	guiding	principles	of	SCP?	
● Which	of	these	values	do	you	personally	share/identify	with	an	an	alum?	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	when	SCP	‘s	publicly	succeeded	at	something.	
● How	did	you	feel	that	moment	reflected	upon	you,	as	an	alum?	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	that	publicly	failed	at	something.	
● How	did	you	feel	that	reflected	upon	you,	as	an	alum?	
● Do	you	have	other	(non-alumni)	identities	at	SCP	(parent,	employee,	coach,	etc.)?	
● How	do	you	feel	these	additional	identities	shape	your	identity	as	an	alum?	
● How	would	you	characterize	your	sense	of	belonging	within	the	SCP	community?	
● If	you	could	describe	your	alma	mater	in	one	or	two	words,	what	would	they	be?	
● Tell	me	what	makes	the	community	of	alumni	here	distinct.		
● How	do	you	feel	that	being	an	alumnus	of	this	school	informs	your	overall	identity?	
● On	average,	how	many	times	per	year	do	you	openly	classify	yourself	as	an	alumnus	

of	SCP?	
● Tell	me	a	story	about	when	you	felt	connected	in	a	special	way	to	your	identity	as	an	

alumnus/a	of	your	alma	mater.	
○ Why	do	you	think	you	felt	a	sense	of	connection?	

■ What	did	you	do	in	that	moment?	
■ What	did	others	do?	(your	classmates,	your	family,	your	school	com-

munity)	
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● Share	a	story	about	a	time	when	you	have	engaged	in	meaningful	shared	activities	

(excluding	purely	social	events)	with	other	SCP	alumni.	
● How	was	information/knowledge	shared	in	this	moment?	
● Would	you	describe	your	involvement	in	these	types	of	non-social	activities	

as	peripheral,	supporting,	or	actively	leading?	

• 	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	when	you	have	witnessed/participated	in	the	SCP	alumni	com-

munity	come	together	in	order	to	solve	a	problem,	accomplish	a	goal,	or	share	
valuable	knowledge?		

○ How	did	that	feel?	
○ If	you	could	choose	that	or	a	social	event,	what	would	be	your	

preference,	and	why?	
	

● Do	you	see	yourself	more	at	the	center	of	the	alumni	community,	or	at	its	
edges/boundaries?		

● Have	you	ever	given	to	your	alma	mater’s	annual	fund?	
● If	so,	how	did	it	feel	to	give	a	gift?	
● What	types	of	things	motivate	you	to	make	a	gift	to	any	organization?	
● What	do	you	wish	would	happen	when	you	give	a	gift?	
● When	you	do	not	give	a	gift,	why	is	that?	

	
● What	would	inspire	you	most	to	give	a	financial	gift	of	any	size	to	SCP?	

	
● How	would	you	describe	the	alumni	community’s	relationship	with	SCP’s	current	

school	community	of	faculty/staff,	parents,	trustees,	and	administrators?		
	

● Who	at	SCP	notices	your	engagement	as	an	alumnus/a?	

• 	

● What	do	they	think	alumni	bring	to	the	community?	

• 	

● What	is	the	alumni	community’s	involvement	in	setting	direction	for	the	SCP	com-
munity?	
	

	
	
Conduct	Interviews	(30	minutes):	
My	notes:	
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Post-Interview	Reflections	
What	did	I	hear?	What	am	I	learning	about	the	root	causes	that	contribute	to	the	problem?		
Are	there	questions	I	wish	I	would	have	asked	or	not	asked?	Are	there	questions	that	
were	particularly	fruitful?	Did	I	probe	effectively?	
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Carrie	M.	Grimes,	M.A.	
Doctoral	Candidate	at	Vanderbilt	University	
Empathy	Interview	Template	for	Capstone	Research:	Alumnus/a	Interview	&	Focus	Group	
	

	
Alumni	Engagement	Research:	Empathy	Interview	and	Focus	Group	Framework	

	
Primary	Goal:		To	gain	a	deeper	understanding	of	a	user’s	experience	as	an	alumnus/a	of	
this	independent	school,	through	lenses	of	social	identity/community	of	practice	theories.	
	
Goals	for	Alumni	Empathy	Interviews:	&	Focus	Groups	

● Seek	to	understand,	not	confirm	
● Ask	once,	clearly—avoid	yes/no	questions	
● Ask	questions	that	elicit	stories	and	feelings	
● Welcome	dialogue	within	the	group	
● Remember	to	probe:	“Tell	me	more…”		“What	was	that	like	for	you?”	“Why?”	

	
Questions:	
	

● How	would	you	describe	overall	alumni	engagement	at	SCP?	
● What	do	you	believe	are	the	common	core	values	and	guiding	principles	of	SCP?	
● Which	of	these	values	do	you	personally	share/identify	with	as	an	alum?	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	that	SCP	publicly	failed	at	something.		
● How	did	you	feel	that	moment	reflected	upon	you,	as	an	alum?	
● Tell	me	about	a	time	that	SCP	publicly	succeeded	at	something.		
● How	did	you	feel	that	moment	reflected	upon	you,	as	an	alum?	
● Do	you	have	other	(non-alumni)	identities	at	SCP	(parent,	employee,	coach,	etc.)?	
● How	do	you	feel	these	additional	identities	shape	your	identity	as	an	alum?	
● How	would	you	characterize	your	sense	of	belonging	within	the	SCP	community?	
● If	you	could	describe	how	you	feel	about	your	alma	mater	in	one	or	two	words,	

would	it/they	be?	
● Tell	me	what	makes	the	community	of	alumni	here	distinct.		
● How	do	you	feel	that	being	an	alumnus	of	this	school	informs	your	overall	identity?		
● On	average,	how	many	times	per	year	do	you	openly	classify	yourself	as	an	alumnus	

of	this	institution?	
● Tell	me	a	story	about	when	you	felt	connected	in	a	special	way	to	your	identity	as	an	

alumnus/a	of	your	alma	mater.	
○ Why	do	you	think	you	felt	a	sense	of	connection?	

■ What	did	you	do	in	that	moment?	
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■ What	did	others	do?	(your	classmates,	your	family,	your	school	com-
munity)		
	

● Share	a	story	about	a	time	when	you	have	engaged	in	meaningful	shared	activities	
(excluding	purely	social	events)	with	other	SCP	alumni.	

● How	was	information/knowledge	shared	in	this	moment?	
● Would	you	describe	your	involvement	in	these	types	of	(non-social)	activities	

as	peripheral,	supporting,	or	actively	leading?	
	

● Tell	me	about	a	time	when	you	have	witnessed/participated	in	the	SCP	alumni	com-
munity	in	order	to	solve	a	problem,	accomplish	a	goal,	or	share	valuable	knowledge?		

○ How	did	that	feel?	
○ If	you	could	choose	that	or	a	social	event,	what	would	be	your	

preference	and	why?	
	

● Do	you	see	yourself	more	at	the	center	of	the	alumni	community,	or	at	its	
edges/boundaries?		

	
● Have	you	ever	given	to	your	alma	mater’s	annual	fund?		

○ If	so,	how	did	it	feel	to	give	a	gift?	
○ What	types	of	things	motivate	you	to	make	a	gift	to	any	organization?	
○ What	do	you	wish	would	happen	when	you	give	a	gift?	
○ When	you	do	not	give	a	gift,	why	is	that?		

	
● What	would	inspire	you	most	to	give	to	a	financial	gift	of	any	size	to	SCP?		

	
● How	would	you	describe	the	alumni	community’s	relationship	with	SCP’s	current	

school	community	of	faculty/staff,	parents,	trustees,	and	administrators?		

• 	

● Who	at	SCP	notices	your	engagement?	

• 	

● What	do	they	think	you	bring	to	the	community?	

• 	

● What	is	your	involvement	in	setting	direction	for	the	community?	
	
Conduct	Interviews	(30	minutes):	
My	notes:	
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Post-Interview	Reflections	
What	did	I	hear?	What	am	I	learning	about	the	root	causes	that	contribute	to	the	problem?		
Are	there	questions	I	wish	I	would	have	asked	or	not	asked?	Are	there	questions	that	
were	particularly	fruitful?	Did	I	probe	effectively?	
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Carrie	M.	Grimes,	M.A.	
Doctoral	Candidate	at	Vanderbilt	University	
Data	Collection	Rubric	for	Capstone	Research	
	
	

Data/Media	Collateral	Collec-
tion	

Collected?		

Annual	Report	2016-17	 X	
Annual	Report	2017-18	 X	
Median	Annual	Giving	Gift	by	Alumni/ae	
(last	10	years)	

X	

Alumni	Print	Media/Mailings	2015-2019	 X	
Alumni	Volunteer	Data	 N/A	
Alumni	Events	Data/Attendance	 X	
Alumni	Board/Leadership	Mission,	mem-
bership,	programming		

X	

Alumni	Social	media	handles/feeds	 X	
Alumni	Networking	Platforms	(In	House,	
Evertrue,	Graduway,	etc.)	

N/A	

Alumni	Programming	Calendar	2015-2019	 X	
Median	Annual	Giving	%	Participation	by	
Alumni/ae	
(last	10	years)	

X	

Alumni/School	Magazine	(2015-2019)	 X	
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Analytic Memo 1 

 

I’m interested in understanding why alumni of independent schools are often disengaged from 

their alma maters. I’m defining alumni engagement as a group of behaviors in which alumni ded-

icate their time, give of their talents, and/or make financial gifts to their alma mater. I’m also 

incorporating another element to this definition: the interactions alumni have with fellow alumni 

which enhance the alma mater’s networks of communication, collaboration, and/or camaraderie.  

The topic of alumni engagement has been of greater relevance in the last decade, as the land-

scape of alumni relations has begun to shift in the wake of social media and other forms of 

technology which empower alumni to collectively reconnect and reminisce without the institu-

tional resources (i.e. a printed alumni directory) of their alma mater. It bears further relevance as 

many independent schools across the country struggle to make ends meet. Schools cannot rely on 

tuition dollars and the financial gifts of current parents alone to survive and thrive; alumni are an 

underleveraged resource which all independent schools would benefit from better galvanizing. 

Independent school administrators remained puzzled by the fact that their mostly successful, of-

ten affluent alumni, many of whom shared seminal life experiences and established enduring 

friendships at their institutions, withhold gifts of time, talent, and treasure from their alma ma-

ters.  

Through my graduate school network, I’ve been fortunate to secure a research site (SCP) 

which is an exemplar of this phenomenon. Despite possessing a large and prosperous alumni 
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community, their annual giving from alumni is less than half the national average, and their over-

all alumni engagement is languid. Other characteristics of this institution are quite impressive: a 

large endowment, full enrollment, expansive state-of-the-art facilities, and outstanding college 

admissions data all tell a story of an otherwise healthy, vibrant, engaged community. Therefore, 

it seems like an ideal setting in which to explore this common problem of practice. 

So far in my first day here, I’ve conducted three interviews. Two were with school ad-

ministrators, and one was with an alumna. The administrators I interviewed were both employees 

within the school’s advancement office, which is comprised of a team of nine employees who 

focus on gift solicitation, event management, and alumni relations. All three interviews have al-

ready highlighted some similar themes related to a lack of alumni engagement. The department’s 

director, who just completed her second year at SCP, had strong opinions about the ways in 

which the approach and style of certain advancement employees affected alumni engagement 

outcomes. She also responded to some interview questions by wondering out loud about how she 

might affect alumni engagement outcomes through her personnel management choices.  My in-

terview with her was long relative to the protocol I had designed, with a significant amount of 

“wandering” in which she talked about power structures at SCP, the circumstances prior to her 

onboarding, and her impressions of independent school culture vis a vis the high education land-

scape, in which she had worked for the last 25 years before coming to SCP. She suggested, for 

the most part, that while SCP was making some progress in how it engaged alumni, it still had a 

long way to go—and she was unsure how they would go about doing a better job of it. She de-

scribed alumni engagement as “very, very limited,” and stated that “until last year, and 
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particularly this year, we did not know what our alumni were doing. We didn't have their busi-

ness titles, we had them living at mom and dad's house. So we really did not have an alumni 

relations program.” She alluded to aggressive initiatives around collecting updated alumni data, 

which would enable them to more effectively reach alumni.  

My other two interviews were with longtime stakeholders—one was an employee and the 

other an alumna employee who had attended the school for 12 years and recently relocated back 

to the area.  Both were able to shed more of an historical light on the challenges around SCP’s 

alumni engagement, and how that connected back to the school’s leadership as well as infrastruc-

tural challenges within “the old” development office (before the current Director was put in 

place). One of the interviewees expressed disgust at the longstanding practice of the institution 

repeatedly soliciting alumni, while simultaneously having a void of meaningful alumni relations 

programming. “So we have no alumni engagement program, but yet we're continually soliciting 

them over and over…that doesn't work so well. And not a targeted solicitation—a general annual 

fund appeal, like, ‘Dear alumni’.”  The other interviewee echoed this sense of disappointment 

about SCP’s inability to engage with alumni. “Prior to my return to the area, I can't really re-

member lots of points of contact, maybe once in a while, I would get some kind of pamphlet or 

something with a request for the, you know, to donate to the SCP fund.” Interestingly, despite 

these expressions of dissatisfaction, when asked about their feelings about being a member of the 

SCP community, both expressed authentic and potent feelings of pride. I’m interested to note if 

this disconnect (of disappointment and pride) emerges in other interviews.  

I’m eager to sit down later today and tomorrow with more alumni, to garner a sense of 

their user experience with the program. I’m wondering if those delivering the program might 
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have an inaccurate portrait of how the alumni actually feel about it? I’m also wondering how the 

alumni interviews I conduct today and tomorrow will compare with my interviews with alumni 

who are not local to campus. I suspect there will be a distinct difference.   
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Analytic Memo 2 

 

The last two weeks of interviews have played an important role in enhancing my understanding 

of alumni disengagement within independent school communities. While I was on campus at 

SCP earlier this summer, I had the opportunity to learn the perspectives of alumni and adminis-

trators who were in close proximity to campus. Despite their varied ages, some of these 

individuals had multiple layers of identity in addition to that of alumnus/a, such as employee, 

coach, parent, and/or alumni parent. At the time I wondered if the combination of these inter-

viewees’ multiple identities and their proximity to SCP would result in their engagement being 

naturally higher with SCP. (While reflecting upon this, I reached out to my internal point person, 

to reaffirm that my additional interviewees were definitely not in proximity to campus.) Under-

standably (and as the current literature demonstrates) my on-campus interviews demonstrated 

that alumni who are geographically closer to their alma mater are more likely to engage with it. 

Also, as the research shows, those with more powerful salience of identity (as I witnessed in my 

interviewees who were alumni, parents, and employees) are more likely to be engaged. In these 

ways, the pre-existing literature about alumni relations was reflected in my conversations from 

my on-campus visit last month. It’s been interesting to speak recently with non-local alumni and 

see how much that impacts their feelings of belongingness and pride, as well as their engagement 

behaviors toward SCP. 

My interviews with non-local alumni have all been conducted over FaceTime or the tele-

phone (whichever the alumnus/a preferred) and have proved to be as rich in content as my in-

person interviews.  Certain themes were very clear in these conversations—most notably the 
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SCP core value of “academic excellence,” the feeling of “pride” alumni felt with regards to their 

affiliation with SCP, and the fact that neither of these concepts seemed to motivate them to give 

a financial gift back to SCP. Rather, as one alumna noted, “I have no kids there--I don't have any 

horse in that race anymore… So you know, I give money to things that are closer and nearer to 

me.” Another noted, “I'd probably allocate those funds to other causes that I’m more passionate 

aboutbecause we're not there. And like, I know, my kids aren't going to go there…I just see my-

self putting my money more into causes that are more relevant to me at this point in my life.”  

Some alumni I spoke with were able to identify specific feelings of closeness, despite their geo-

graphic distance, cultivated through nostalgic relationships with their former teachers, or 

ongoing relationships with their SCP friends. Unlike locals, who focused on engaging via their 

currently enrolled children or a valued local alumni professional network, non-local alumni more 

often referenced friends and mentors associated with SCP.  One talked fondly of SCP faculty, 

including a teacher with whom he has maintained a close connection for over 30 years, “I have a 

lot of very fond memories of my teachers. She's obviously one that's I've remained very close 

with, and that’s all because of the school--so that there's a glow on this from her, that is reflected 

on the school.” When alumni described the impact that SCP relationships they personally cherish 

have on their overall alumni connection with SCP, the results varied. For some, those cherished 

relationships fortified their identification with the institution. For others, there was little to no im-

pact. One interviewee said “I don't really feel a connection to the school anymore. But I do still 

have a strong connection to some of my close friends from the school.”  

Now that I’ve been able to interview non-local alumni with singular institutional identi-

ties, I’m looking forward to going back and listening to the interviews I did on campus. I’m 
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wondering how the similarities and differences between these interviewees’ points of view might 

help me better understand the overall problem of practice. I also can understand how the context 

of the current organization plays a significant part in the ways in which local alumni might re-

connect to their alma mater. That is to say, if I spend time on campus as an alumna/us around the 

people, buildings, and programs that shape it today, aren’t I more likely to look for reflections of 

myself within that place? Whether it be through thinking about my own memories from my time 

on campus, running into former teachers or schoolmates who work there, or catching part of a 

sporting event for a team on which I used to play?   

The literature review suggested that affinity groups were another motivator for alumni to 

engage—my interviews have involved mentions of athletic and arts affinity groups with which 

alumni still felt a strong connection and sense of identity. I’m hoping my documents/ media re-

search can shed some light on the most prevalent affinity groups at SCP—maybe enliving these 

alumni sub-communities would be an avenue for meaningful, highly nostalgic alumni interac-

tions? Another echo from the literature review has been around legacy. Both local and non-local 

interviewees referenced the high relevance of having one’s own children attend (or not) SCP. 

I’m thinking that a greater programmatic emphasis on SCP legacy families would be a low-

stakes easy win for the advancement team as they seek to grow alumni engagement.  
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CODES	 CATEGO-
RIES	

THEMES	

Event(s)	
Reunion	
Attendance/turnout	
Money	
Social	
Engagement	
Outreach	
Gift	

• Do	events	matter?	
• Room	to	grow	
• Why	give?	
• Mixed	feelings	
• Attendance	vs.	

meaning	

ALUMNI	ENGAGEMENT	

Academic	Excellence	
Character	
Intelligence	
Work	Ethic	
Citizenship	
Prestige	
Success	

• Academic	excel-
lence	&	hard	work	

• Nationally	known	
and	respected		

• Guiding	moral	
compass:	charac-
ter,	education,	
leadership	

• Alumni	values	re-
flect	SCP	values	

CORE	VALUES	

Family	
Community	
Teacher/coach	
Home	
Caring/love	
Pride/Proud	
	

• Relationships	
• Affection	for	insti-

tution	
• Close	knit	family	

feel	
• Pride	

• 	

COMMUNITY	AND	CULTURE	

Legacy	
Lifer	
Identity	
Friends	
Self	
Live	near	
Connecting/connection	
Feeling	
	

• Intertwinement	of	
identities	

• Alumni	identity	
value	proposition	

• Differing	perspec-
tives	on	
belongingness	

• Pride	and	Prestige	
• Outsiders	vs.	Insid-

ers	

SOCIAL	IDENTITY/BELONG-
INGNESS	
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• Geographic	influ-
ence	

Support	
Learn	
Collaborate	
Expertise	
Mentor/mentoring	
Knowledge	
Network	
Advice	
Service	

• Good	work	
• Sharing	knowledge		
• Mentoring	oppor-

tunities	and	
challenges	

• The	alumni	bee-
hive	

• Something	besides	
happy	hour	

• Sharing	knowledge	
through	mentor-
ship	

MEANINGFUL	SHARED	PRAC-
TICE	

Social	media	
Mail	
Sharing	
Story	
Memories/memory	
Personal	
Nostalgia	
Genuine	

• Communication	hit	
&	misses	

• Alumni	stories	em-
bedded	within	
larger	community	
context	

• Nostalgia/folklore	
• Power	of	personal	

stories	
• Resonance	within	

alumni	network	

NARRATIVES/STORYTELLING	
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Concept	 Theme	 Key	Quotes	 Theme	 Key	Quotes	 Theme	 Key	Quotes	 Documents/Me-
dia	

Alumni	Engagement	
• Event	participa-

tion	

• Gifts	

• Outreach	to	

alumni	

	

Do	

events	

matter?		

“There	are	some	

regional	events	

that	happen,	but	

they	are	often	

on	a	week	

night…getting	

there	is	not	su-

per	easy	so	my	

engagement	has	

been	through	

Facebook	

groups	and	at	

reunions.”	

	

“In	all	honesty	if	

I	asked	my	

alumni	friends	if	

they	wanted	to	

go	an	alumni	

event	they’d	say	

no.”	

	

“At	events	I	at-

tended	there	

was	a	kinship	

that	we	all	went	

to	SCP	but	it	was	

Room	to	

grow	

“Definitely	en-

gagement	is	

skewed	toward	

local	alums...I’m	

so	removed	

from	it	geo-

graphically.”	

	

“Engagement	is	

spotty.	I	proba-

bly	engage	

more	with	the	

school	than	

they	engage	

with	me.	But	

it’s	getting	bet-

ter.”	

	

“They’re	always	

asking	for	

money.	It	

doesn’t	seem	

like	there	is	any	

rhyme	or	rea-

son	as	to	why	

they	do	what	

they	do.”		

Why	give?	 “I’d	allocate	my	

funds	to	causes	

I’m	more	passion-

ate	about.	SCP	is	a	

fabulous	institu-

tion,	but	I	see	

putting	my	money	

into	causes	that	

are	more	relevant	

to	me	at	this	point	

in	my	life.”	

	

“If	you	care	about	

a	place	and	it	

means	something	

to	you,	then	you	

have	to	give	

something	back	to	

it,	to	show	that	

you	care.”	

	

“I	might	give	to	

SCP	if	my	gift	

were	going	to	a	

scholarship	for	a	

student	who	

couldn’t	afford	

• AlumniConnect	

collateral	

• Donor	Report	

• Alumni	Website		

• Internal	events	

data	reports	
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also	a	great	way	

to	network	and,	

you	know,	see	

where	life	has	

taken	other	peo-

ple.”	

	

“Most	people	

come	to	alumni	

events	to	see	

what	teachers	

are	coming.	

They	want	to	

see	their	old	

teachers.”	

	

	“The	primary	

mode	of	engage-

ment	for	alumni	

is	alumni	

events…I	think	

engagement	is	

so-so.”	

	

“On	a	scale	of	

one	to	10	en-

gagement	is	

maybe	like	a	

one	or	two…It’s	

improving,	but	

there	is	defi-

nitely	more	

room	for	im-

provement.”	

	

“The	outreach	

from	the	school	

is	pretty	

low…it’s	usu-

ally	for	you	to	

donate.	But	en-

gagement	

within	groups	

of	alumni	is	

pretty	high.”	

	

	

SCP,	or	if	it	was	to	

create	a	health	

center	on	campus	

for	students.”	

	

“When	a	place	

like	SCP	seems	

just	flush	with	

money	I’m	not	

compelled	to	

give.”			

	

“When	I	gave	a	

gift	to	SCP	it	let	

me	recognize	

where	I	came	

from.	That	felt	

good,	even	though	

places	like	the	Ba-

hamas	may	need	

my	money	more.”		

	

“I	just	gave	some	

money	because	

the	development	

office	did	a	thing	

about	talking	

about	a	favorite	

teacher	so	I	do-

nated	money	in	



	

	

	

	

Appendix	I	

Alumni	Engagement	Master	Interview	Matrix:	Alumni	

	

	

	 72	

honor	of	XXX.	So	

that	

was	motivating	

for	me	to	honor	a	

faculty	member.”	

	

Core	Values		
• Distinctiveness	

of	community	

• Perceived	Pres-

tige	

• Alumni	identifi-

cation	with	PCS	

values	

	

Success	

&	

smarts	

	

“Kids	that	come	

out	of	SCP	are	

very,	very	smart	

and	very,	very	

motivated.	

They’re	impres-

sive.”		

	

	“Going	to	a	prep	

school	in	this	ge-

ographic	area	

was	a	really	dis-

tinct	and	

interesting	ex-

perience.	It	was	

a	different	kind	

of	world	from	

other	prep	

school	experi-

ences.”		

	

“People	that	

went	to	SCP	

have	a	desire	to	

Aca-

demic	

excel-

lence	

&hard	

work	

“Academics	ex-

cellence	first	

and	fore-

most…the	

school	prides	

itself	on	being	

the	best	of	the	

best,	also	integ-

rity,	

preparation,	

and	a	focus	on	

community.”	

	

“Academic	ex-

cellence…that’s	

the	only	thing	

that	comes	to	

mind.”	

	

	“Community,	

education,	aca-

demic	

excellence,	

leadership,	and	

Alumni	

values	re-

flect	SCP	

core	val-

ues	

“I	identify	with	

trust	and	

honor...the	moral	

values	are	the	

ones	I	identify	

most	with…not	so	

much	the	aca-

demic	prowess.”	

	

“I	identify	with	

the	sense	of	com-

munity.”	

	

“We	have	a	lot	of	

prestigious	

alumni.	I	think	

that’s	important,	

because	people	

relate	to	that	level	

of	excellence—it’s	

kind	of	a	status	

thing.”	

	

• School	magazine	

alumni	profiles	

• Website	

• Founder’s	auto-

biography	

• Magazine	

• School	profile	

• Strategic	Plan	
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be	successful,	

productive	

adults.	There	is	

a	unique	drive.”	

	

	“Work	ethic—

you	have	to	be	

smart	and	work	

hard	to	go	to	

SCP.	There	is	a	

deep	educa-

tional	

foundation	that	

people	who	

went	to	other	

schools	don’t	

have.”	

	

“To	go	to	SCP	

and	succeed	at	

SCP	you	need	to	

be	

smart…among	

my	peers	in	col-

lege	I	was	very	

prepared.”	

	

	

	

	

strong	ethics	

and	values.”	

	

“A	commitment	

to	character,	

excellence,	hard	

work	and	com-

munity.	There	

is	a	consistent	

shared	devo-

tion	to	making	

SCP	the	best	

place	that	it	can	

be.”	

	

	“Academic	ex-

cellence,	to	

build	future	

leaders,	to	fos-

ter	social	

skills.”	

	

“Character,	

leader-

ship…and	

preparing	kids	

for	the	real	

world.”	

	

“Character	is	the	

most	important	

thing	I	connect	

with…it’s	more	

important	to	me	

than	academic	ex-

cellence.”	

	

“Adaptability	and	

the	ability	to	pre-

sent	well	in	the	

world	are	things	I	

identify	with	

strongly.”	

	

“All	of	them—I	

connect	with	all	of	

SCP’s	core	val-

ues.”	
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	 “There	is	an	ex-

pectation	of	

high	achieve-

ment.”		

	

Independent	School	
Community	and	Cul-
ture	

• Close	knit	“fam-

ily”	

• Enduring	rela-

tionships	

• Affection	for	in-

stitution	

Endur-

ing	

relation-

ships	

“In	my	experi-

ence	I	think	

there	was	a	very	

strong	bond	

with	a	lot	of	

teachers…my	

sister	is	still	in	

touch	with	her	

first	grade	

teacher.”	

	

“When	there	is	

news	about	re-

tired	teachers	

dying,	it’s	amaz-

ing	to	see	the	

outpouring	on	

social	me-

dia…my	brother	

recently	basi-

cally	wrote	a	

Facebook	eulogy	

about	his	former	

teacher	who	

died.”	

Affec-

tion	and	

pride	

for	insti-

tution	

“They	way	that	

SCP	has	in-

vested	in	the	

facilities	is	just	

huge…it’s	

grown	so	

much…and	that	

gives	me	some	

pride	about	my	

alma	mater.	I	

feel	affection	

for	the	school	

since	it’s	where	

I	spent	my	

formative	

years.”	

	

“I	feel	tremen-

dous	pride.	I	

think	very	

highly	of	the	

school.	I	want	

my	children	to	

go	there	and	to	

graduate	from	

Close	knit	

“Family”	

feel	

“SCP	was	a	unique	

school	experi-

ence.	It	was	a	

small	tight	knit	

group	and	there	

was	a	lot	of	mu-

tual	respect	for	

different	types	of	

people.	I	look	for	

that	now	that	I	am	

raising	kids.”		

	

	“I	have	a	lot	of	

very	fond	memo-

ries	of	my	

teachers.	There's	

one	that's	I've	re-

mained	very	close	

with.	It’s	all	be-

cause	of	the	

school…there's	a	

glow		from	her	

that	is	reflected	

back	on	the	

school…at	this	

• Social	media	

pages/groups	

(Facebook)	

• Magazine	

• Quarterly	Alum-

niConnect	e-

newsletter		
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	“The	people	

that	I	feel	closest	

to	are	my	

friends	from	

SCP.	We	don’t	

talk	a	lot,	but	

there	is	a	con-

nection	that	I’ve	

never	replicated	

anywhere	else.”	

	

“I’m	very	proud	

of	my	SCP	

friends…we’re	

still	very	close.	I	

have	this	core	

group	of	friends	

who	are	my	life-

long	friends.”	

	

	

	

	

	

	

	

there	and	enjoy	

many	of	the	ex-

periences	I	had	

there.”		

	

“When	I’m	here	

I	do	feel	like	I	

came	home.	I	

mean,	after	you	

think	about	

how	many	

years	you	

know,	you	

spend	on	cam-

pus,	I	started	in	

kindergarten,	

and	you	know,	

how	many	

years	I'll	be	

here	as	a	parent	

now.	Yeah,	it's	a	

really	special	

place.”	

	

“I	have	intense	

pride,	I	love	the	

school,	I	am	

very	thankful	

and	have	grati-

tude	for	the	

point	she	is	fam-

ily...we	built	a	

family	relation-

ship.”	

	

“There	are	people	

at	SCP	who	have	

been	part	of	my	

life	for	40	years.	

There	are	still	a	

couple	of	my	

teachers	there.	I	

feel	great	affinity	

toward	them.	I	

have	so	many	

fond	memories	of	

people	from	SCP	

caring	for	me	way	

beyond	the	class-

room.”	

	

“There	is	a	close-

ness	and	sense	of	

family	at	SCP	that	

I	think	is	really	

special.”	
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experience	I	

had.”	

	

“I’m	very	proud	

that	I	went	to	

SCP.	It	was	a	

good	school.	

You’re	with	a	

very	elite	

group.”	

	

Social	Identity/Be-
longingness	

• Layers	of	Iden-

tity	

• “Intertwine-

ment”	&	

salience	

• Alumni	share	

identity	mark-

ers	of	

competence,	

ability,	work	

ethic		

• PCS	Self-con-

cept	ranking	

• Pride	of	iden-

tityAffinity	

groups	

Multiple	

Identi-

ties	

cher-

ished		

	“When	you	tab-

ulate	all	of	those	

vantage	points	it	

makes	for	a	rich	

understanding	

of	the	school	

and	apprecia-

tion.	The	

identities	are	all	

intertwined…I	

feel	like	they’re	

all	rolled	up	into	

one.”	

	

“Your	identity	is	

with	those	peo-

ple	that	you	

spent	all	those	

hours	with,	you	

Pride	&	

prestige	

“Once	you	grad-

uate	from	

college,	I	don't	

know	that	

where	you	

went	to	high	

school	is	looked	

at	when	you're	

applying	for	

jobs…especially	

if	you’re	not	liv-

ing	near	SCP.”	

	

“The	fact	that	I	

went	to	SCP	

doesn’t	really	

inform	my	

identity	today,	

in	my	everyday	

Outsiders	

vs.	insid-

ers	

“Our	20th	reunion	
was	kind	of	im-

personal…I	felt	

disconnected	

from	SCP	at	that	

point—there	was	

a	lack	of	personal	

touch.	It	was	very	

generic.	I	felt	dis-

tant	from	the	

school.”	

	

“I	don’t	really	feel	

a	connection	to	

the	school	any-

more.”		

	

“I’m	an	outsider.	

I’m	not	involved.	I	

• Magazine	

• Social	media	

handles	

• Website	
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know,	every	sin-

gle	day,	for	

years,	Here	and	

outside	of	here.	

That's	part	of		

who	you	are.”	

	

“Having	multiple	

identities	at	SCP	

gives	me	a	

glimpse	into	the	

life	of	the	school	

from	all	these	

other	different	

perspectives.	

And	I	think	

that…contrib-

utes	to	my	sense	

of	the	school,	

like	I	have	a	

much	deeper	

and	fuller	un-

derstanding	

SCP.”	

	

“Being	a	lifer	at	

SCP	is	a	big	

deal…it	is	

strictly	defined	

as	someone	who	

life…I	don’t	live	

there.”	

	

“When	I	tell	

people	I	went	

to	SCP	and	they	

say	what	a	good	

school	it	is,	I’m	

proud	of	that	

and	I	like	that--

it	makes	me	

feel	good	about	

myself.”	

	

“SCP	is	known	

as	one	of	the	

top	schools	in	

the	country.	To	

know	that	I	

went	to	a	

school	that	is	

top	tier	is	a	

badge	of	

honor.”	

	

“A	lot	of	the	

person	I	am	to-

day	came	from	

my	time	at	

SCP.”	

don’t	want	to	go	

to	anything.	I’m	

not	giving	them	a	

penny.”	

	

“My	sense	of	be-

longing	is	very	

strong…I’m	on	the	

LinkedIn	group	

and	I	login	to	the	

alumni	page	and	

see	what	every-

body	is	up	to.”	

	

“It’s	powerful…I	

feel	close	to	my	

friends.	It	would	

be	upsetting	to	

me	not	to	main-

tain	relationships	

with	people	

there.”	

	

“I	felt	at	home	at	

SCP.	With	all	the	

awkwardness	of	

teendom,	I	felt	at	

home	there.	It	still	

feels	like	coming	

home,	even	
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started	in	kin-

dergarten	and	

graduated.”	

	

“I	feel	very	

proud	to	be	as-

sociated	with	

the	school.	We	

are	high	rank-

ing	nationally,	

and	that	feels	

good.”		

though	I	hardly	

know	anyone	

there.”	

	

“I’m	definitely	at	

the	edges	of	the	

alumni	commu-

nity…on	the	

outskirts.”	

	

Meaningful	Shared	
Practice	

• Sharing	of	

knowledge/pas-

sions	

• Doing	“good	

work”	

• Mentorship	

• Voluntary	gal-

vanization		

• Newcomers	&	

Oldtimers	

Some-

thing	

besides	

happy	

hour…	

“If	SCP	was	do-

ing	something	

worthwhile,	like	

helping	people	

register	to	vote,	

or	marching	to	

bring	awareness	

to	a	social	cause	

I	believe	in,	I’d	

be	inclined	to	

get	that	going	

where	I	live	

too.”	

	

“One	alum	put	

together	an	an-

nual	flag	football	

day…it's	proba-

bly	50	people	

The	

alumni	

beehive	

“We	put	to-

gether	a	

networking	

group.	We're	

basically	get-

ting	together	

once	every	two	

months	as	we	

continue	to	de-

velop	in	our	

professional	ca-

reers,	and	

helping	each	

other	grow	in	

all	aspects	of	

our	lives.”	

	

“I’d	say	that	

1/3	of	my	cli-

ents	at	work	

Sharing	

knowledge	

and	men-

torship	

	“SCP	makes	an	ef-

fort	to	have	

successful	alumni	

come	back	and	

speak	to	the	stu-

dents…and	the	

alumni	love	this.”	

	

“I	think	we	should	

do	more	mentor-

ing.	I	think	that's	

one	of	the	really	

great	benefits	you	

can	have	within	

an	alumni	net-

work…even	

someone	like	my-

self	could	

probably	use	a	

• LinkedIn	alumni	

group	page	
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who	get	to-

gether	to	play.	

We	are	former	

SCP	athletes.	

The	school’s	not	

involved.”	

	

“I	remember	a	

teacher	ran	for	

office.	Alumni	

came	out	and	re-

ally	campaigned	

for	that	guy!”	

	

“If	somebody	

from	SCP	was	in	

my	area	and	do-

ing	charitable	

work	that	I	be-

lieved	in,	I’d	

probably	get	in-

volved.”		

	

“Maybe	if	I	lived	

closer	I	would	

do	choose	to	

give	back	at	a	

service-type	of	

are	SCP	alumni.	

SCP	alumni	

send	and	share	

professional	re-

ferrals	through	

the	alumni	net-

work.	You’re	

more	trusting	

to	do	business	

with	an	SCP	

alum.”	

	

“Some	of	my	

clients	now	are	

alums	and	

friends	of	al-

ums.	We’re	

helping	each	

other	out.	It’s	

very	rewarding.	

It	feels	good.	

We	share	a	his-

tory	that	

cannot	be	ri-

valed	by	

someone	who	

is	not	from	that	

background.”		

	

mentor,	quite	

frankly.”	

	

“If	somebody	is	in	

the	legal	field,	and	

they	need	advice,	

I'd	love	to	help	

that	person	out.	

You	know,	just	

give	them	any-

thing	that	I've	

learned…and	kind	

of	steer	them	in	

the	right	direc-

tion,	I	mean,	

helping	out	SCP	

alumni	is	defi-

nitely	something	

that	I	would	want	

to	do.”	

	

“Mentoring	is	crit-

ical.	I	think	it's	

something	that,	

you	know,	is	re-

ally	lacking	in	SCP	

alumni	engage-

ment.	And	I	think	

that	that	particu-

lar	relationship	
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event	over	par-

ticipating	in	a	

social	event.”	

	

“There's	an	

alum	that	

has	a	construc-

tion	company,	

and	I'm	in	real	

estate,	and	

we're	thinking	

of	working	to-

gether.	Another	

alum		helped	

my	dad	with	

something	on	

estate	planning.	

So	yeah,	from	

the	network,	

the	profes-

sional	SCP	

network,	yes,	

I've	taken	ad-

vantage	of	

that.”	

	

between	mentor	

and	mentee,	re-

ally	develops	a	

very	close,	strong	

bond,	and	when	

you're	trying	to	

build	a	sense	of	

community,	and	

that's	certainly	

one	way	to	do	it.”	

	

Narratives/Storytell-
ing	

• Communica-

tions	

• Stories	

• Nostalgia	

• Folklore	

Commu-

nication	

collapse	

“Somewhere	

along	the	line	

communication	

from	SCP	

dropped	off	and	

I	stopped	paying	

attention…I	feel	

like	the	people	

Per-

sonal	

stories	

“Hearing	per-

sonal	stories	of	

people	who	

have	been	

helped	by	gifts	

to	SCP	who	are	

less	fortunate--

then	I	might	

Nostal-

gia/folklor

e	

“I	had	such	close	

relationships	with	

some	of	my	teach-

ers.	I	still	

remember	words	

that	some	of	my	

elementary	

school	teachers	

• Website	

• AlumniConnect	

e-newsletter	

• Facebook	page	

• Instagram	han-

dle	

• Linked	In	page	
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who	are	local	

get	a	lot	more	

engagement	

from	SCP.”	

	

“I	can’t	remem-

ber	many	points	

of	contact	from	

SCP.	Once	in	a	

while	I	got	a	

pamphlet	in	the	

mail	with	a	re-

quest	for	a	

donation…and	

maybe	notifica-

tion	of	regional	

events	in	my	

area.	But	that’s	

all	I	can	think	

of.”		

	

	

feel	more	com-

pelled	to	

donate	or	vol-

unteer.”		

	

“I’ve	seen	one	

or	two	teachers	

who	passed	

away	and	there	

were	literally	

hundreds	of	

comments,	sto-

ries	and	

memories	

about	these	

people	shared	

on	social	media.	

It	was	incredi-

ble	to	see	the	

community	

come	together	

like	that.”	

	

“A	story	about	

an	actual	event,	

or	a	personal	

story--that	

would	maybe	

inspire	me	to	

said	to	me	35	

years	ago.	I	treas-

ure	those	

memories.”	

	

“Every	time	I	have	

to	write	some-

thing,	I	always	

think	about	my	

ninth	grade	Eng-

lish	teacher.”	

	

“Nostalgia	plays	a	

big	role	at	SCP.	

Huge.	There's	a	

Facebook	page	

where	alumni	

post	all	kinds	of	

things	about	nos-

talgic	memories	

like	chicken	fried	

steak	and	gravy,	

or	Mr.	Turner	

measuring	our	

skirts,	or	Mrs.	Dee	

taking	attend-

ance.”	

	

“Our	school	

founder	is	an	

• School	founder’s	

autobiography	
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give	a	gift	to	

SCP.”	

	

	

	

	

iconic	figure.	I	

still	have	a	photo	

of	her	handing	me	

my	kindergarten	

diploma.”	

	

“We	have	an	or-

ganization	called	

the	Founder’s	

Council,	and	this	

group	has	given	

the	same	awards,	

at	the	same	as-

sembly,	in	the	

same	way	for	50	

years.	It’s	a	

hugely	nostalgic	

tradition.”			
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Key	Themes:	alumni	engagement,	core	values,	community/culture,	social	identity/belongingness,	meaningful	shared	
practices,	and	stories/narratives	
Document/Media	Se-
lected	

Data/Content	Presented	 Concept	Illuminated	 Evidence	

Recent	annual	reports/	

“President’s	Report	of	

Giving”	

Digital	content	provided	for	last	

4	years	

Alumni	Engagement	(Do-

nor)	

Donor	lists	by	constituency;	donor	categories;	

alumni	gift	lists	relative	to	other	constituents;	

number	of	donors	(alumni	vs.	other	constitu-

ents);	lack	of	donor	engagement	in	the	form	of	

gifts	evident	(3-4%);	“Alumni	Loyalty	Society”	

and	“Alumni	Giving	by	Decade”	noted		

Annual	giving	data	 Spreadsheet;	year-over-year	 Alumni	Engagement	(Do-

nor)	

Number	of	alumni	donors	shows	slight	increase	

in	last	4	years;	amount	of	total	gifts	shows	

steady	increase	since	2015-16;	possible	trend	

of	strategic	cultivation	of	high	net	worth	donors	

and	upgrade	in	SCP	data	integrity;	also	hiring	of	

2	alumni	gift	officers	in	2017	

Alumni	magazine	 Digital	and	print	content	(pho-

tographs,	captions,	brief	

articles)	

Social	identity/belonging-

ness,	alumni	engagement,	

core	values,	commu-

nity/culture	

Legacy	breakfast,	alumni	council,	homecom-

ing/reunion,	“pride”,	Honorary	Alumni	

program;	“so	many	students	and	parents	knew	

the	campus	as	a	community	that	felt	small	and	

warm—like	a	home.”,	“SCP	planted	the	seed	for	

a	life	of	inquiry”-alumnus,	alumni	affinity	

groups	(theater,	television	production,	distance	

running);	“rigor”		

Alumni	postcards	 Digital	copies	 Alumni	engagement	(So-

cial),	belongingness		

“Your	SCP	family”,	group	photos	
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Document/Media	Se-
lected	

Data/Content	Presented	 Concept	Illuminated	 Evidence	

Internal	advancement	

staff	survey	

Digital	spreadsheet	 Alumni	engagement	(Do-

nor),	narratives,	core	values	

“How	good	is	your	office	at	promoting	con-

sistent	message	about	the	importance	of	

philanthropy	with	alumni?”,	“competitive	ad-

vantage”	(what	distinguishes	SCP),	school’s	

historical	narrative	as	pertains	to	supporting	

fundraising	efforts	

Alumni	events	attend-

ance	data	

List	provided,	only	reflects	

2018-19	event	cycle	

Alumni	engagement,	com-

munity	

1410	alumni	attended	events	across	9	distinct	

locations	in	2018-19	

Alumni	board	docu-

ments	

Digital	list	of	members	“Alumni	

Connect	Cabinet”	published	in	

annual	report—no	other	docu-

ments	available	

	 Reps	in	New	York,	San	Francisco,	Boston,	D.C.,	

Miami	and	Chicago;	reunion	year	leaders	noted	

for	5	reunion	classes	

Facebook	handle	 Own	page	for	Alumni	(separate	

from	school’s	page)	Digital	feed,	

“About”,	“Groups”	,	“Videos”		

Alumni	engagement,	com-

munity/culture,	social	

identity/belongingness,	sto-

ries/narrative,	core	values	

1967	followers/9049	alumni	=	22%	engage-

ment	rate;	“The	mission	of	the	SCP	Alumni	

Association	is	to	support	SCP	in	its	commitment	

to	excellence	by	re-engaging	SCP	alumni	world-

wide.”,	class	notes,	advertising	of	upcoming	

events,	alumni	profiles,	“Flashback	Friday”	nos-

talgia	posts,	High	engagement	on	faculty	posts	

“If	you	could	ask	Mr.	XXXXXXXX	any	question,	

what	would	you	ask	him?”,	Nostalgia	videos	

“Chickenfried	steak”	&	“Favorite	memories	

from	SCP	teachers”,	affinity	groups	celebrated	

(dance),	core	values	“intelligent,	creative,	amaz-

ing,	bound	to	be	successful”	

Instagram	handle	 Digital	feed—one	page	for	

alumni	and	school	

Community/culture,	be-

longingness,	

narrative/stories	

“#alumnitakeovertuesday”	(alumni	“hijack”	the	

feed	with	personal	stories/memories),	“We	are	

Family”		
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Document/Media	Se-
lected	

Data/Content	Presented	 Concept	Illuminated	 Evidence	

LinkedIn	page	 Private	digital	group	 Alumni	engagement	 952	members,	“A	social	and	professional	

alumni	group	for	all	who	have	attended	or	

graduated	from	SCP.	With	over	8000	alumni,	

this	nearly	80	year	old	private	college	prepara-

tory	school	has	educated	many	and	the	

nation's--most	successful	business	leaders.”	

Archives	 Book	written	by	the	school	

founder	in	1978	

Narrative/stories,	core	val-

ues	

Section	dedicated	to	“old	grads”	and	“alums”	

(alumni)--	addendum	of	“letters	from	the	grad-

uates”,	“the	high	caliber	and	achievement	of	our	

students	and	the	success	of	our	alumni	are	

SCP’s	only	excuse	for	being”,	“self-discipline”		

Alumni	section	of	SCP	

website	

Alumni	Section	of	SCP	website	 Alumni	engagement,	mean-

ingful	shared	practice	

“Ways	to	Get	Involved:	There	are	many	ways	

for	you	to	benefit	from	our	community,	but	you	

can	also	make	a	difference	for	students	and	fac-

ulty.”	List:		Attend	events,	submit	class	notes,	

visit	campus,	share	your	time	(volunteer	at	

alumni	events,	be	a	guest	speaker	at	the	

school’s	civic	forum,	volunteer	in	the	parents’	

association	or	helping	solicit	for	the	annual	

fund),give	a	gift	to	the	annual	fund	

SCP	Strategic	Plan	 2019-2024	plan	 Core	values,	alumni	engage-

ment,	meaningful	shared	

practice	

Values:	“excellence,”	“challenging	academics,”	

“community,”	“inclusion,”	“compassion,”	“coura-

geous	leadership”,	Financial	sustainability	

through	“advance-ment	efforts”	and	“facilitating	

opportunities	for	collaboration	among	students,	

faculty,	alumni	and	parents,	including	through	

mentorship	and	programming”		

 


